
From: "Rich Kahn" 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: investigator invoice 

Date: Tue, 02 Nov 2010 14:07:01 +0000 

Attachments: AR-M455N_20101101_211755.pdf 

Attached is invoice for DV Carpenter Inc. in the amount of 1619.25. 
Should I pay or have Jack pay? 
Please advise. 

Rich Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York. NY 10065 
tel 
fax 
cell 

 Original Message 
From: Jack Goldberger (mailto 
Sent: Tuesday, November 02, 2010 10:04 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: invewstigator invoice 

Rich, 
Attached is an investigator invoice for some work JE and I discussed. I only have $490 in my 
cost account. Can you wire in about $2500 for this and any other incidental costs that may 
come in Jack 

 Original Message 
From: Michaele Saxon 
Sent: Monday, November 01, 2010 10:18 PM 
To: Jack Goldberger 
Subject: Scanned image from Atterbury Goldberger & Weiss ARM455M 

DEVICE NAME: Atterbury Goldberger & Weiss ARM455M DEVICE MODEL: SHARP 
AR-M455N 
LOCATION: Atterbury Goldberger & Weiss 

FILE FORMAT: PDF MMR(G4) 
RESOLUTION: 300dpi x 300dpi 

Attached file is scanned image in PDF format. 
This file can be read by Adobe Acrobat Reader. 
The reader can be downloaded from the following URL: 

http://www.adobe.com/ 
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