
From: Cecile de Jongh 
To: J E <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Re. Peter Rillero 
Date: Fri, 05 Nov 2010 22:33:31 +0000 

FYI 

Warm regards, 

Cecile 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Lawrence Krauss < 
Date: November 5, 2010 6:05:01 PM GMT-04:00 
To: Cecile de Jongh 
Cc: Lawrence Krauss 
Subject: Re: Re. Peter Rillero 

btw.. I need to be reimbursed 8 x $220 = $1760 USD for the two condos.. you can mail me a check.. thanks.. 

LMK 

On Nov 5, 2010, at 1:52 PM, Cecile de Jongh wrote: 

He will be reimbursed. 

Warm regards, 

Cecile 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 5, 2010, at 3:20 PM, Lawrence Krauss > wrote: 

he was invited as an assoc. director of origins.. I don't see how we can expect him to be out of pocket after 
having invited him, whether or not he will be coming back. 

On Nov 5, 2010, at 11:02 AM, Cecile de Jongh wrote: 

OK, he won't be coming back but we need to reimburse him for the ticket. Should I go ahead 
and do so? 
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DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected 
from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any 
dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

From: Jeevacation <jeevacation© mail.com>
To: Cecile de Jongh < > 
Cc: Lawrence Krauss < >; Lawrence Krauss 

Sent: Fri, November 5, 2010 2:00:19 PM 
Subject: Re: Re. Peter Rillero 

Definitely not. I'm not sure why he was invited the first time. 

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 5, 2010, at 9:26 PM, Cecile de Jongh

Jeffrey, 

> wrote: 

; Darren Indyke 

Dr. Peter Rillero was invited by Lawrence to attend the ASU Origins meeting which, as we all 
know, was canceled/postponed. Dr. Rillero and several others purchased tickets for their 
spouses (we told them that they could bring spouses but they had to pay for their air fare). 
Now that there is no meeting, they are cancelling the tickets, which are non-refundable, and 
they would like to get reimbursed for their spouses' tickets. I have a few questions: 

Is Dr. Rillero someone who will be invited to the rescheduled meeting next year? 
If not, how should I handle the reimbursement? 

Warm regards, 

Cecile 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and 
protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any 
dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 
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