
From: Lawrence Krauss < 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Re. Peter Rillero 

Date: Fri, 05 Nov 2010 22:02:17 +0000 

I agree.. :) did you enjoy Science Friday today... just flew in to do it.. origins of morality meeting is going on.. 
fascinating.. evolutionary psychology on now... steve pinker giving a very interesting commentary. 

On Nov 5, 2010, at 12:22 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

of course he will be reimbursed the definetly not was relating to his being reinvited sorry„ he is hardly of your 
calibre. 

On Fri, Nov 5, 2010 at 3:20 PM, Lawrence Krauss < > wrote: 
he was invited as an assoc. director of origins.. I don't see how we can expect him to be out of pocket after 
having invited him, whether or not he will be coming back. 

On Nov 5, 2010, at 11:02 AM, Cecile de Jongh wrote: 

OK, he won't be coming back but we need to reimburse him for the ticket. Should I go ahead 
and do so? 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confldential, and protected 
from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any 
dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

From: Jeevacation <jeevacation@ mail.com>
To: Cecile de Jongh < > 
Cc: Lawrence Krauss < >; Lawrence Krauss 

Sent: Fn, November 5, 2010 2:00:19 PM 
Subject Re: Re. Peter Rillero 

Definitely not. U not sure why he was invited the first time. 

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 5, 2010, at 9:26 PM, Cecile de Jongh 

Jeffrey, 

> wrote: 

>; Darren Indyke 

Dr. Peter Rillero was invited by Lawrence to attend the ASU Origins meeting which, as we all 
know, was canceled/postponed. Dr. Rillero and several others purchased tickets for their 
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spouses (we told them that they could bring spouses but they had to pay for their air fare). 
Now that there is no meeting, they are cancelling the tickets, which are non-refundable, and 
they would like to get reimbursed for their spouses' tickets. I have a few questions: 

Is Dr. Rillero someone who will be invited to the rescheduled meeting next year? 
If not, how should I handle the reimbursement? 

Warm regards, 

Cecile 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and 
protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any 
dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

Lawrence M. Krauss 
Foundation Professor 
Director, The ASU Origins Project 
Co-Director, Cosmology Initiative 
Assoc. Dir, Beyond Center 
ARIZONA STATE UNIVERSITY 
College of Liberal Arts and Sciences 
School of Earth and Space Exploration 
PO Box 871404 I Tempe AZ 85287-1404 

http://krauss.faculty.asu.edu 
Exec. Asst (Jessica 
Origins Asst (Cynthi 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationOganail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

Lawrence M. Krauss 
Foundation Professor 
Director, The ASU Origins Project 
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Co-Director, Cosmology Initiative 
Assoc. Dir, Beyond Center 
ARIZONA STATE UNIVERSITY 
College of Liberal Arts and Sciences 
School of Earth and Space Exploration 
PO Box 871404  Tempe AZ 85287-1404 

http://krauss.faculty.asu.edu 
Exec. Asst (Jessica) 
Origins Asst (Cynthi
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