
From: "Rich Kahn" <MI > 
To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.corn> 

Subject: re: Ryan Dionne 
Date: Mon, 01 Nov 2010 16:16:18 +0000 

Ryan paid 9,250 to date 
Open invoice 3,125 (Oct 11 - Oct 15) 

Ryan was paid $3,000 for 4 days @ 750 per day September 22-25 (one day was for GM) 
Ryan was paid $6,250 for 2 weeks Sept 27 - Oct 1 and Oct 4 - Oct 8 
(150,000 prorated) 

Please advise 

Rich Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 646-862-4811 
fax 
cell 

 Original Message 
From: Ryan Dionne (mailto: 
Sent: Friday, October 29, 2010 3:59 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: Wire transfer 

Appreciate the response. I realize you are caught in a difficult position, what I don't quite 
understand, severance issue aside, is why it is an issue to pay me for the llth-15. He agreed 
to hire me at that salary, I worked and got quite a bit done despite never really being given 
any direction. 

Keep me posted. 

Ryan 

Sent from my iPad 

On Oct 29, 2010, at 11:00 AM, "Rich Kahn" 
wrote: 

> Did not forget about you 
> Thanks for your patience 

> • Rich Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
> 301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
> New York, NY 10065 
> tel 646-862-4811 
> fax 
> cel 

• Original Message 
> From: Ryan Dionne [mailto: 
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> Sent: Wednesday, October 27, 2010 10:12 AM 
> To: Rich Kahn 
> Subject: Wire transfer 

> Rich, 

> Please let me know when the wire will be sent and if it will include 
my 
> last weeks pay plus the two weeks severance for a total of $9,375. 

> • Thank you, 

> • Ryan 
> Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 
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