
From: "Rich Kahn" 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: re: Insurance claim 

Date: Thu, 07 Oct 2010 15:29:44 +0000 

Importance: high 

Priority: Urgent 

Attachments: RMS_CLAIM_REQUEST_-_Client_Information.pdf; Hurricane_Earl_Clean_up.xlsx 

Working on it now with Emad and as you can see below we have requested that Gary produce budgets for 
insurance company. 

I have attached report from insurance company and our estimate of labor clean up ($85,000). 

I think total dollars net of deductibles will be $150,000 - $200,000 with an outside chance for more depending on 
how the dock damages play out. I will keep you updated as I learn more. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cell 

From: Emad Hanna 
Sent: Wednesday, October 06, 2010 1:51 PM 
To: 
Cc: Rich Kahn; bgordon.lsj contact 
Subject: Insurance claim 
Importance: High 

Gary, 

I just spoke to the insurance agent and was advised that we need to compile the cost for either fixing or replacing 
the damaged structures. 

EFTA00755572



I will need you to put together a budget for each structure ASAP. 

I have compiled the labor costs for the clean up and the cost for replacing the beach lighting and transformers 
(see attached spreadsheet) 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

Cell 

Work SIT 

Work NY 

Fax 
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