
From: ' 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

Date: Sun, 10 Oct 2010 18:12:43 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

Fancelli wants to get payed the balance of the additionals ( 22.000) I said when all finished. I payed Friday 
18.000 for his last trip (?) And seems wants again money for this one. I gave instructions to proceed if this is all 
it takes. Hope you will help me going after him when all is finished. 

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Jeevacation <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
Date: Sat, 9 Oct 2010 13:37:25 +0200 
To: Lesley Groff 
Cc: jp 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

Fancelli lawyers said that jp is not paying what he is supposed to 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 8, 2010, at 6:46 PM, "Lesley Groff" •cl l> wrote: 

From: [mailto 
Sent: Friday, October 08, 2010 12:15 PM 
To: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

Hello Lesley, please tell Jeffrey that ALL the lawyers are speaking now, so hopefully they will have an 
arrangement and the guys are going to be at the island next week. I have been in and out of the 
Hospital, it has been difficult to be able to communicate with him, and I have not been "that" well as 
to have long discussions, sometimes I feel I'm in a cloud! But things are looking much better now in 
all things, as soon as I have the last resolutions I will contact J. Thanks for the patience! J.P. 

---Original Message--
From: Lesley Groff 
To: 
Sent Fri, Oct 8, 2010 10:04 am 
Subject: Jeffrey Epstein 

Hello JP! Jeffrey would like to speak with you. Could you please give me a call and I will connect you to him? 
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Thank you so very much, 

Lesley 
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