
From: "Rich Kahn" czMI > 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: Tuition Invoices 

Date: Tue, 21 Sep 2010 15:11:17 +0000 

Attachments: American-Skidmore.pdf 

Rich Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York, NY 10065 

 Original Message 
From: Cecile de Jongh [manta: 
Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2010 11:08 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Fw: Tuition Invoices 

Rich, 

Has Jeffrey said anything to you about this? I asked him and he said that he needed to talk 
to you and then I emailed him. I have paid their room and board but I am so late with this 
and I need to get it taken care of before Please let me know. 
Thanks. 

Cecile 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and 
protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified 
that any dissemination, distribution 

or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

  Forwarded Message 
From: Cecile de Jongh 
To: JEE 
Sent: Fri, September 17, 2010 
Subject: Tuition Invoices 

4:43:08 PM 

Hi Jeffrey, 

Sorry to bother you with this but I spoke to Rich last week and he said that you 

needed to discuss this. If there is a problem, please let me know. 

Warm regards, 

EFTA00755934



Cecile 

EFTA00755935


