
From: "Rich Kahn"

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com>, "Emad Hanna"

Cc: "Gary Kerney"

Subject: RE: Maguire office pavilion 

Date: Mon, 26 Apr 2010 14:02:45 +0000 

Attachments: Maguire_ Paid_to_Date_4-23-2010.pdf 

Attached is Maguire Payment History 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Sunday, April 25, 2010 7:14 AM 
To: Rich Kahn; Emad Hanna 
Cc: Gary Kerney 
Subject: Re: Maguire office pavillion 

i want gary to see the total paid to macguire to date.. 

On Sun, Apr 25, 2010 at 7:06 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

no answer yet. 

 Forwarded message   
From: Gary Kerney <I 
Date: Tue, Apr 20, 2010 at 3:51 PM 
Subject: Maguire officepavillion 
To: Darren Indyke , Rich Kahn < 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Darren 
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1. I found a contract dated 4-25-06 for engineering S140.000 plus $60.000 reimbursables to be signed by Amerling 

2. I found a draft architectural contract no Ws. According to meeting minutes Miller and Doug were negoiating,but no 
documents ,Bill was not included in any meetings at this point but was copied with minutes of some meetings 

3.Jeffrey asked me to review Maguire costs. 

4.1 assume you have copies of contracts and work orders that Doug and Charles executed .none are in Monique's files. If 
so please forward them to me. 

5.Rich can you send me the costs to date for Maguire on the office pavilion 

Thanks 

Gary 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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