
From: "Rich Kahn" 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: Dr. Kruger... 

Date: Mon, 05 Apr 2010 13:15:53 +0000 

We were going to try to use flight option hours however they have not budged on their original offer of $50,000 in hours 
for your 1/16 share. 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailtojeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2010 3:21 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: Dr. Kruger... 

wait 

On Wed, Jan 20, 2010 at 3:18 PM, Rich Kahn wrote: 

I spoke with Doctor Kruger who informed me that of the two gifts he received in the amount of $25,000 each he only used 
$13,000 of time leaving a balance of $37,000 unused. Would you like me to purchase him a new card? If so how much 
and from which company? Or should we wait until I hear back from Flight Options and try to transfer some of the hours 
we get? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

tel 

cel 

From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2010 10:58 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: FW: Dr. Kruger... 
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From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailtojeevacation@gmail.com 
Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2010 10:57 AM 
To: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: Dr. Kruger... 

tell him i intend to replace his hours. tell rich kahn to figure out how many flight option hours we are owed.. did 
rich call joelpashkow as i asked. 

On Wed, Jan 20, 2010 at 10:46 AM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

Hi Jeffrey...just want to keep you abreast of some conversations I have had with Dr. Bernard Kruger. Back in 
Dec. of 07 you gave him a gift certificate with Cerulean Jet. Dr. Kruger never used the entire GC and has been 
trying to contact Cerulean. It appears Cerulean is out of business. Dr. Kruger has not been able to contact 
them...I did some research and found that Air Atlanta Helicopters has the phone number Cerulean was using. I 
receive voice mail only every time I call ...I had Larry Visoski look into this matter also and he has basically 
found the same things as me. Larry also said he imagined the charter hours had a time limit to use, which may 
have expired and/or went out of business...I looked back at the `gift notice' that was sent to Dr. Kruger from 
Cerulean and it says nothing of an expiration date or the hours that you purchased for him. 

I know Dr. Kruger did not want to make a big deal of this...he said if Cerulean is still in business he may want to 
book a trip...but that is it. 

I was going to email him and let him know the company is out of business, but I thought I should let you know 
first. 

Les 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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