
From: "Rich Kahn" 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: March Statement 

Date: Tue, 06 Apr 2010 15:19:20 +0000 

Darren and Harry are both out today 

Can I send you wires to sign and then I will patch in bank to verbally confirm? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cel 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [rnailtoleevacation@gmalkoom] 
Sent: Tuesday, April 06, 2010 11:17 AM 
To: Dee Craig 
Cc: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: March Statement 

please take care of today 

On Tue, Apr 6, 2010 at 10:04 AM, Dee Craig wrote: 

Dear Jeff & Rich, 

Attached is the statement for March showing a balance due of $27,392.59, this includes a previous balance of 
$25,125.50 for which payment was not made. 

Regards, 

Dee Craig 
Billing & Accounts Payable 
Black Srebnick Komspan & Stumpf 

EFTA00761150



201 S. Biscayne Boulevard 
Suite 1300 
Miami. FL 33131 

Fax: 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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