
From: "Rich Kahn" 

To: "Jeevacation" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: LSJ Wire 

Date: Thu, 11 Mar 2010 20:23:20 +0000 

Attachments: 03-11-10-Rimeo-Requl.pdf 

Attached is request for payment of generators totaling 75,247.50. 

Backup has your signature however I wanted to make sure it was ok to send today? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 

New York, NY 10065 

From: Emad Hanna 
Sent: Thursday, March 11, 2010 3:07 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: 'Daphne Wallace'; 'William Rowles'; Monique Harry 
Subject: LSJ Wire 

Rich, 

Please process a wire in the amount of $ 75,247.50 (see attached) 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

); 'Gary Kemey'; 'Darren Indyke' 
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HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 
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