From: "Steven Victor MD" q~—'-'-*
To: "Jeff F1" <jeevacationwgmail .com=>
Subject: Fw: Pro-forma invoice for Lipokit & its FPU syringesl - Shipping Schedule
Date: Fri, 05 Mar 2010 12:35:06 +0000
Importance: Normal

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile
Steven Victor MD

From: peter jung < =

Date: Fri, 5 Mar 2010 15:10:48 +0900

To: < >

Ce: < e

Subject: Re: Pro-forma invoice for Lipokit & its FPU syringesl - Shipping Schedule
Dear Dr. Victor,

We are confirming the shipment of Lipokit & Maxstem w/ syringes to vou from Korea today. After inland
trucking to Incheon Airport, the air-freight will be actually shipped tomorrow. In accordance, I'm preparing to
visit your clinic next Tuesday or Wednesday on or after shipment arrival to you so that [ can instruct how to use
and 1f available, assist you for your 1st surgery using Lipokit and Maxstem. At your side, please prepare the
enzyme for dissociation of fat tissues for ASC 1solation. We are currently using Worthington-brand collagenase
Typel or type I -filtered, but KFDA approved to use the collagenase after optimal washing process, but as you
know, US FDA is still regulative for the collagenase, non-sterile or non GMP grade ones.

At this time, you will be OK to prepare for the Worthington-brand collagenase ( as in our protocol) next week,
but in future, vou can use GMP grade Collagenase.

[ will let you know the specific shipping details soon.

I'm in Arizona, but if required, call me at my cell || I or by email.
See you in next week.

Thanks,
Peter Jung

Medi-Khan Inc.
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Dear Steven Victor, MD

Thanks for your acceptance on the terms and conditions of our PO.

EFTA00763400



Yes, | will arrange for the shipment of Lipokit and Maxstem with FPU syringes for fat grafting and ASC
isolation today.

And I can also schedule my flight to NYC and will stay one or two days for my assistance for your 1st case of
fat grafting and stem cell theray.

Thanks
Peter Jung, COO

Medi-Khan Inc.

Cell. (N

201034 -

Peter

| accept the terms of the attached PO. Please make arrangements for shipping and your training
trip to NYC.

Please give me dates so we can confirm a case of liposuction for the training.

Thank you!

Sincerely,

Steven Vietor, M.D.

VICTOR DERMATOLOGY AMD REJUVEMATION
LASERSCULPT, INC

NEW YORK, NEW YORK 10021

ﬁ Help save paper not printing if not neadad
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