
From: "Rich Kahn" 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation(kgmail.com> 

Subject: FW: Andrew W. Levy 

Date: Tue, 16 Feb 2010 15:56:43 +0000 

Attachments: Andrew_Levy_Inv 1.pdf 

FYI - This vendor used to bill thru Hasan Khan at $40 per hour 

Attached invoice has a billing rate of $30 per hour 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cell 

From: Emad Hanna 
Sent: Friday, February 12, 2010 2:03 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: FW: Andrew W. Levy 

From: Monique Harry [mailto 
Sent: Friday, February 12, 2010 1:57 PM 
To: Daphne Wallace 
Cc: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Andrew W. Levy 

Daphne, 

Please process the attached invoice. Gary spoke to Rich, which said to charge Invoice to Architectural 
General Ledger Account. 
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Monique Harry 

Hotmail: Trusted email with powerful SPAM protection. Sign up now. 

EFTA00763748


