
From: "Gary Kerney" 
To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: St Jan Botanical 
Date: Wed, 17 Feb 2010 20:47:10 +0000 

Emad has informed me below that Darren and rich require that any over budget by line item payments be 
approved by you. The item in question is to complete the distribution of the sewer affluent and is over budget by 
about $3,000 due to my bad estimate. I need your approval. This process is going to become a big issue in the 
future as every line item is a estimate and as we discussed in the begining every line is going to be over or under 
if I give you honest estimates. To relive the burden of our going thru this erxercise I suggest you give me a 10% 
or $10,000 athority 
Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Emad Hanna" 
To: "Gary Kerney" 
Cc: "Monique Harry" 
Subject: FW: St Jan Botanical 

Gary, 

Just to follow up the message I just left you on your voice mail. 

I have been informed that any line item that is over budget must be approved by JE so you will need to get 
approval 

Thank 

From: Monique Harry [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, February 11, 2010 5:33 AM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: St Jan Botanical 

Good Morning Emad, 

Attached for payment St. Jan Botanical in the amount of $3,495.00. Project #1005 Code 02-441. 

Monique 
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