
From: Darren Indyke < 

To: "Critton Jr. Jr." < , Jessica Cadwell

Subject: Fwd: Scanned image from Atterbury Goldberger & Weiss ARM455M 

Date: Wed, 28 Oct 2009 21:04:13 +0000 

Attachments: AR-M455N_20091026_220958.pdf 

I received your note requesting payment of the McIntosh invoice for $7,327.76, but the ok to pay does not reflect 
the comments that Bob made on the invoice which I got from you on October 16 indicating that a $125 
adjustment was in order to the McIntosh invoice. I just want to make sure that we should pay the adjusted 
amount. Please check with Bob and get back to me. 

Also, I just received this new Cohen invoice from Jack. Please have Bob review. Would like to give JEE one 
request, rather than in piecemeal. 

Thanks. 

Darren 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: October 26, 200911:09:58 PM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Scanned image from Atterbury Goldberger & Weiss ARM455M 
Reply-To: 

DEVICE NAME: Atterbury Goldberger & Weiss ARM455M 
DEVICE MODEL: SHARP AR-M455N 
LOCATION: Atterbury Goldberger & Weiss 

FILE FORMAT: PDF MMR(G4) 
RESOLUTION: 300dpi x 300dpi 

Attached file is scanned image in PDF format. 
This file can be read by Adobe Acrobat Reader. 
The reader can be downloaded from the following URL: 

http://www.adobe.com/ 
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