
From: "Rich Kahn" 

To: "Jeevacation" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: October invoice 

Date: Thu, 29 Oct 2009 16:47:28 +0000 

Attachments: Epstein_invoice,_10-23-09.pdf 

Please advise if ok to pay Gary and Steve October invoice in the amount of $43,365.20. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

From: Sharon Myers [mailto: 
Sent: Friday, October 23, 2009 11:31 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: October invoice 

Attached is the invoice for October. Let me know if you have any questions. 

Sharon C. Myers 

Landmark Land Company Inc. 
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