
From: "Rich Kahn" <I 
To: "Martin Weinberg" ctl 
Cc: "Jeffery Edwards" <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: RE: CONFIDENTIAL 
Date: Fri, 30 Oct 2009 17:38:15 +0000 

Yesterday payment was made in the amount of S85.428.20 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

From: Martin Weinberg [mailto 
Sent: Friday, October 30, 2009 1:33 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Jeffery Edwards 
Subject: CONFIDENTIAL 

Rich 

Can you update me on the payment of the prior two months of invoices? Thanks 

Marty 

Martin G. Weinberg 
MARTIN G. WEINBERG, PC 

**************************************************************************** 

This Electronic Message contains information from the Law Office of Martin G. Weinberg, 
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and may be privileged. The information is intended for the use of the addressee only. If you are 
not the addressee, please note that any disclosure, copying, distribution, or use of the contents 
of this message is prohibited. 
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