
From: "lvjetd 
To: "Je vacation" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: boeing 
Date: Mon, 02 Nov 2009 14:42:49 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

Not pre approved, sean said it was a verbal deal that he has with you, his commission is 100k plus advertising 
when it sells, 
But the S76 didn't sell, I pulled it from sean and gave to Reenstra, after 9 months of trying.. 
Its up to you, I told him I wouldn't pay the S76 invoice, that you would have to approve. He said he really needs 
us to pay it,,, 
This just came about a month ago only 

Thx 
Lany 

Sent from my BlackBeny® wireless handheld 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Date: Mon, 2 Nov 2009 09:29:09 -0500 
To: <LVJET 
Subject: Re: boeing 

was it pre approved,,, i know nothing about it 

On Mon, Nov 2, 2009 at 9:22 AM, <LV.Alla,vrote: 
I do believe that Sean is great on the buying end of a deal, however, it been to long not getting even a low ball offer on he 
Boeing„ 
,I have already discussed the possibility of Reenstra selling the Boeing several months ago. Let me talk to Sean and ask 
him what the interest has been lately, also, I thought about giving the Boeing to Wendy Wentworth aircraft, they have many 
other B727 in their inventory for sale, nothing better than ours,,, 
however Wendy and Sean are good friends, I'm sure she'll deal with us, should we lower the price to 7M ask? 

"`"what would you think about leasing the Boeing to David Berstein, to use in the Arab market place and generate income 
and possible sale? just a long shot...I am still discussing the BonJovi tour starting in Feb with David, he is working on a 
pricing for you on this tour. 

Note: Bristol has given me an invoice for $12,000 + for advertising the S76C++ in which they did not sell the helicopter„ 
and also an invoice for $6,500+ for advertising the Boeing which has not sold,,,I told Sean I would not approve this invoice, 
that I would present it to you for discussion or approval. 

thanks., 
harry 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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