From: "Rich Kahn" q~_°
To: "Jeevacation” <jeevacation{@gmail.com=>
Subject: RE: Outstanding Balance
Date: Fri, 18 Sep 2009 16:33:18 +0000

Doug, Janusz and Brice all told me that they have not given Worth any direction for the

future work mentioned below....

Plaase advise

Eich Eahn

HBERE Assocliates Inc.
PO Box 400

Mew York

From: Jeevacation [mailto:jeevacationfgmail.com]
Zent: Thursday, September 17, 2009 1:46 PM

To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Re: Outstanding Balance

Ask I don't know and tell Doug I asked him to call days ago

Zent from my iPhone

on Sep 17, 2008, at 1:42 pM, "rich Kahn" <[}

WEOT2

> I am confused from this email as I told bo
» that

> per your wishes Worth i1s not to do anymore work at 358 E1 Brillo.
> Please adwvise.

Janusz, Brice and Doug

» Rich Kahn

» HBRE Aszsociatesz Inc.
> PO Box 400

> New York, NY 10150

- Criginal Message-----

> Prom: Stewve Simon jmai'_t-:::_]
» Sent: Thursday, September 17, Z00% 1:31 EM

> To: Rich Eahn

Dave Chesser

> Subject: FW: Outstanding Balance

> Rich

» We currently hawve an outstanding balance of 512,264.58 representing
= work
> completed in June, July and August. We are now being asked to do

EFTAO00770259



additional framing for afc modifications, benchwork and other tasks

but

are somewhat hesitant to proceed =ince we have not been paid for the

prior periods.
FPlease advise as to when payme
unaware of any problem and nee

aAsSs51lsTance

nt for this work will be made, we are

d to be advised if one does exist. Your

and cooperation is appreciated.

eve Simon

Controller

Worth Builders <f Palm Beach,
1137 Clare Avenue

West Palm Beach, FL 33401

————— Criginal Message—--—---

Inc.

Sent: Monday, September 14, 20

OJutstanding Balan

Steve Simon

Contraller

Worth Builders of Palm Beach,
1137 Clare Avenue

West Palm Beach, FL 33401

————— COriginal Message—--—---
From: Steve Simon [mailto:
Sent: Tuesday, September 08B, 2
To: Rich Kahn |

Zo: Dave Chesser |

Subject: Jutstanding Balance
Hi Rich

I've attached three involces t

account.

We have not been paid for work completed in June and July and I am now

including an invoice for work

09 %:18 AM

cCe

lnea.

ons 2:14 PM
)

o this email and an statement of

completed in August, 200%. We are

currently being regquested to perform additional work per conversations

with Doug 5.

It would be appreciated if we
Flease advise. Thank you.
Steve Simon

Controller

Worth Builders of Palm Beach,
1137 Clare Avenue

West Palm Beach, FL 33401

<Epstein - Invoice Z290B0Z2.pdf>
<Epstein - AR Stmt 53-4-0%.pdf>
<Epstein - Inveoice 290623.pdf-
<Epstein - Invoice 29070&.pdf>

can bring this account current.

Inc.

EFTA00770260



