
From: 
To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Facture Little St James 
Date: Sat, 03 Oct 2009 06:15:20 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

He has been there twice as per his contract, and WE know he couldn't finish then because of the windows and 
floor. I will see if they can adjust their expenses. Doug told me the floor won't be ready until Jan 5th, so he will 
finish the base board with a local carpenter, if not we have to get Fancelli there for a 4th trip. JP. 

Sent from my BlackBerry® wireless device 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Date: • 9:36 -0400 
To: 
Subjec e: acture itt e St James 

no his invoice says that he is goin to charge extra for travel and installation. for these pieces. 

wrote: On Fri, Oct 2, 2009 at 3:56 PM, • 
This is all the extras that we agreed with Fancelli, the items he owes are not charged. JP. 

Sent from my BlackBerry® wireless device 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, I Oct 2009 13:29:44 -0400 
To: Emad Hanna 
Cc: j 
Subje cur James 

they are coming to refinish cabinets.. they cannot chage extra to install these door.. thats ridculos 

On Thu, Oct I, 2009 at 12:26 PM, Emad Hanna < wrote: 

Jeffrey, 

Please see the attached received from Molyneux 

Do we have your approval on this? 

Thank you 
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Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

Ph 

Fa) 

From: Daniel Perdreau [mailto: 
Sent: Thursday, October 01, 2009 12:07 PM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: TR: Facture Little St James 

Dear Sir, 

As per Mr. Molyneux's request, please find Fancelli's invoice Mr. Epstein asked for. 

Best regards, 

Daniel Perdreau. 

Daniel Perdreau 

Secretaire General 

JP Molyneux Studio Ltd 

T: 

F: 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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