From: "Rich Kahn" i_‘*
To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation(@gmail .com=>
Subject: FW: Work Order 17
Date: Tue, 06 Oct 2009 16:19:09 +0000
Attachments: 17.1 - Mechanical Building Rev.pdf; Billing rates.pdf

Do | have your approval to pay a 510,000 retainer to Maguire (for work estimated to cost 553,500 for revisions to the
mechanical building) that Gary has approved?

Rich Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.
PO Box 400

Mew York, NY 10150

tel

From: Gary Kerney [mailto: | |

Sent: Tuesday, October 06, 2009 10:00 AM
To: Rich Kahn
Subject: FW: Work Order 17

here is Maguire, please pay retainer.

Gary

From: Jeff McCormick [mailto: |

Sent: Tue 9/29/2009 5:41 PM
To: Gary kKerney;

Cc: : Rich kKahn
Subject: Work Order 17

Here is a revised work order 17, program adjusted, financial planning budget reduced.

Jett

EFTAO00771073



Jettrey M. MeCormick
Principal Engineer

Mairuir-: Gmur Inc.
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