
From: "Rich Kahn" <1 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Cc: "a <IMIn 
Subject: RE: S76C++ possible sale 

Date: Tue, 13 Oct 2009 18:52:26 +0000 

Attachments: S76_Sales_Analysis.pdf 

Attached is schedule detailing payments to date, remaining payments and potential profit from sale 

Please advise 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.comJ 
Sent: Friday, October 09, 2009 6:58 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: S76C++ possible sale 

what is the payment schedule? 

 Forwarded message -------
From: lvjet 
Date: Thu, Oct 8, 2009 at 8:34 PM 
Subject: S76C++ possible sale 
To: jeevacation gmail.com, DKIESQ < 

Jeffrey, 

George Reestra just called me, he has a possible buyer for our Sikorsky„ he informed me that Sikorsky has at least 2 
green S76C++ for sale in their inventory priced at 11.5M reduced price ready to go into completion, according to George, 
similarly equipped to ours, I would imagine not including the 275K WiFi option we are getting, since we are the first to 
receive it. 
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George thinks this buyer may be willing to pay 12M due to our delivery schedule being Dec 14th, 2009,,,Sikorsky can only 
promise an Oct, 2010 delivery of their Green helicopters. 

-George is unsure how serious this buyer is on purchasing a new or possible used helicopter from him. He mention to me if 
you wanted to do a quick deal, he would take a 150K commission since our profit would be considerably less than the 
Randy Learner deal. 

FYI: we are paying $11,650,000.00 for our current machine, (I need to confirm that price, but I think I'm correct). 

please advise if you are interested in this? 

thanks, 

Larry 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationq4ginail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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