
From: "Richard Kahn" 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fw: FANCELLI EURO PAYMENT 

Date: Fri, 23 Oct 2009 14:45:20 +0000 
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please advise 

- - On Thu, 10/22/09, Andre Sattaur < > wrote: 

From: Andre Sattaur < 
Subject: FANCELLI EURO PAYMENT 
To: 
Cc: "Allison Brantley" 
Date: Thursday, October 22, 2009, 5:49 PM 

Hi Good Evening Rich, 

Just wanted to let you know that we received a Euro payment in the amount of 22,500.00 Euros. We wanted 
to know how you computed to make a deposit of 22,500.00 Euros. It is an odd figure. 

Thx 

Andre 
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