
From: story cowles 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: Little St. James invoice 
Date: Tue, 30 Jun 2009 19:35:28 +0000 

Attachments: Epstein_invoice,_06-24-09.pdf 

Should we pay this or wait until the end of the month? 
It's Caplinger's invoice $20,135.79 

--- On Tue, 6/30/09, Rich Kahn  I> wrote: 

From: Rich Kahn
Subject: FW: Little St. James invoice 
To: 
Date: Tuesday, June 30, 2009, 3:31 PM 

Any update on payment of this invoice? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

tel 

fax 

cell 

From: Sharon Myers [mailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, June 24, 2009 4:29 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Little St James invoice 

Mr. Kahn, 

3 

Stephen Caplinger asked us to send you the attached invoice for expenses paid in June by DPMG, Inc relating to the 
Little St. James project. Let me know if you have any questions. 

EFTA00772312



Sharon C. Myers 

Landmark Land Company, Inc. 

Phone Fax 

EFTA00772313


