From: [N I -
To: Jeevacation <jeevacation(@ gmail.com=>
Subject: Re: Re: Re: Re:
Date: Sat, 25 Jul 2009 17:03:23 +0000

[ only need to go there and sign myself as 1 new student, thats all, ill be free after, but 1 dont have the exact date -
i just know its between the 19th and 28th.

[ am getting over 4000usd from my agency, and for now i need 2700usd to cover my holiday and pay back
money 1 owe again.. Would that be possible?? Thank you.. You are my only chance. e

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 25, 2009, at 6:28 PM, Jeevacation <jeevacation(@gmail.com> wrote:

If yvou have to ge back in aug fit university [ don't understand. How much money

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 25, 2009, at 11:44 AM, | R SSEEN I -, - o

Why not 1'd love to - beginning of sept??? Sounds good??, but before 1 really wanted to get some holiday with
my friends and my boyfriend and 1 just wanted to borrow the money and give it back to you as soon as 1 get
them. I need to go now because at the end of august 1l have to be in town because of university, do you
understand my situation:) 1 just have time for my holiday now, but will get money by the time 1 should be
back from holiday. [ might have no other chance to have them... If you could help me now 1 would be so
erateful, thank ﬁ

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 25, 2009, at 12:38 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail.com=> wrote:

do you wnat to come help in florida,, earn some money and get some sun.

On Wed, Jul 22, 2009 at 1:53 PM, | I I -, - -

Hello!! Where were you?? Enjoving summer:)7?? Well i can only comunicate through emails now-because
1 dont have my computer available...my poor dead macintosh:( so what do you think, could you borrow
me some money until 1 get them from my agency?? I want to get some holiday so bad, you cant imagine,
but its gonna take couple of weeks before 1 get them. Thanks a lot, hope vou are having great summer!!

Say hello to [N

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 22, 2009, at 2:41 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail.com=> wrote:

free and home, just got your emails
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