
From: "Rich Kahn" 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacationggmail.com> 

Subject: FW: LSJ Hammam 

Date: Tue, 28 Jul 2009 15:32:02 +0000 

Attachments: Invoice for June 2009.docx; ALevy_Time Sheet June09.pdf: LStpostage_Jun09- _ _ _ _ 
receipts.jpg 

Please advise. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

From: hasan khan [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, July 16, 2009 12:29 PM 
To: Jeffrey epstein 
Cc: Rich Kahn 
Subject: LSJ Hammam 

Dear Jeffrey: 

Please find attached my invoice for June. 

We are working on adjustments to the Hammam scheme based on some of the observations during the 
recent site visit, and am also doing a final check of all the proportional systems. I have a few questions 
which I will call you about once the revisions are made. 

As per our conversation last week, we are also workinfg on the interiors of the major spaces and should 
have some drawings and sketches for you in about a weeks time. 

Meanwhile, do you have any instructions about getting a preliminary structures and mechanical drawings 
done for the Schemetic Drawings? Gensler has a set on which to work. 

With kind regards, 
Hasan 

EFTA00773095


