
From: "Rich Kahn" <Ma. 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: last of the outstanding Invoices - Maguire Group 

Date: Tue, 28 Jul 2009 19:59:02 +0000 

Attachments: Inv13.pdf; Inv14pdtpdf; inv3.pdf; inv4.pdf 

Doug has approved attached invoices totaling 7,275.94 to the Maguire Group. Do I have your 
approval to pay? 

Rich Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
PO Box 400 
New York NY 10150 
tel 
fax 
cel 

 Original Message 
From: Jeff McCormick [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, July 27, 2009 1:47 PM 
To: Doug Schoettle 
Cc: Rich Kahn 
Subject: last of the outstanding Invoices 

Gentlemen, Hope all is well. 

I am trying to close out old invoices over 60 days old. These last outstanding invoices. 
please let me know status. 

Total 

13 & 14 are for mech bldg. $6,416.05 

3 & 4 are for ex residence as-builts.$859.89 

Jeff 

Jeffrey M. McCormick 
Principal Engineer 
Ma uire Grou Inc. 

EFTA00773107


