
From: "Rich Kahn" • cMa 
To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: Line Payment confirmation 

Date: Thu, 20 Aug 2009 20:46:38 +0000 

Attachments: Mellon0ljpg; Mellon02.jpg 

Attached is verification of $50,000 paid on line of credit. Outstanding balance is now $854,598. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

tel 

fax 

cell 

From: Jeff Fuller [mailto 
Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2009 8:58 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: 
Subject: Line Payment confirmation 

Rich, 

Here is the confirmation of payment. 

Thanks, 

Jeff 

EFTA00773874


