
From: "Bella Klein"

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jecvacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: Dr. Thomas J. Magnani 

Date: Thu, 30 Apr 2009 19:50:15 +0000 

Accounting office promised to reverse the charges and charge directly. 

Thank you 

Bella 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Thursday, April 30, 2009 3:40 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Dr. Thomas J. Magnani 

In fact I told magnanai that i would not pay„ he said she was a model and maybe she could pay some. 

On Thu, Apr 30, 2009 at 12:00 PM, Bella Klein < 

Please see attached invoice from Dr Magnani office 

Thank you, 

Bella 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation(agmail com 
Sent: Thursday, April 30, 2009 11:56 AM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Dr. Thomas J. Magnani 

wrote: 

april 29 isyesterday„ i don't know who that is? 

On Thu, Apr 30, 2009 at 11:41 AM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 

Hi Jeffrey, 

I have an invoice for visit Dr. Magnani on 4/29 for $875. Is the payment authorized? 

Thank you 

Bella 
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