
From: "Rich Kahn" <MI > 
To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: Mr. Epstein 
Date: Mon, 04 May 2009 13:19:03 +0000 

Maguire agreed to 15,000 reduction. Is it ok to wire adjusted balance of 89,398.31? 

Rich Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
PO Box 400 
N w York NY 10150 

 Original Message 
From: Jeff McCormick (mailto: 
Sent: Friday, May 01, 2009 7:06 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: RE: Mr. Epstein 

Yes, Maguire agrees to the 15,000 reduction. Plaease wire funds, thanks for your help. Im 
home... sick kid, will be in office after 9:30 am if you need me. Have a nice weekend. 

Jeff 

Jeffrey M. McCormick 
Principal Engineer 

>>> "Rich Kahn" ‹ > 04/30/09 4:39 PM >>> 
Mr. Epstein said he would agree to a 15,000 reduction not 12,500 Let me know if this works 
and we will wire funds Friday or Monday am. 
Thanks 

Rich Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
PO Box 400 
New York, NY 10150 

 Original Message 
From: Jeff McCormick [mailto: 
Sent: Thursday, April 30, 2009 12:15 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: re: Mr. Epstein 

Im leaving for appt at 2:30, please leave message as you will be out 
tomorrow. 

Thanks 

EFTA00774542



Jeff 

Jeffrey M. McCormick 
Principal Engineer 
Ma uir rou In . 

>>> "Rich Kahn" ‹ > 4/30/2009 12:03 PM >>> 
In a meeting until 2pm 

I will call you after that when I speak with him 

Thanks 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 
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