
From: "Rich Kahn" • 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacationggmail.com> 

Subject: FW: Confidential 

Date: Tue, 02 Jun 2009 13:21:26 +0000 

Attachments: Epstein_-_Invoice_6-1-09.pdf 

Please advise. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

tel 

fax 646-350-0954 

cell 

From: Martin Weinberg [mailto 
Sent: Monday, June 01, 2009 4:55 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: Confidential 

Rich, attached is this month's invoice for legal services. I will email it separately to Jeffrey for his 
review 

---- Original Message ----

From: Rich Kahn 

To: Martin Weinberg 

Sent: Friday, May 15, 2009 11:21 AM 

Subject: RE: Confidential 

Great 

Thanks 

EFTA00775362



Rich Kahn 

H BRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

tel 

fax 646-350-0954 

cell 

From: Martin Weinberg [mailto 
Sent: Friday, May 15, 2009 11:21 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: RE: Confidential 

Receipt confirmed, thanks Marty 

Martin G. Weinberg, Esq. 
20 Park Plaza, Suite 1000 
Boston, MA 02116 
617-227-3700 

cell 

This Electronic Message contains 
information from the Law Office of 
Martin G. Weinberg, P.C., 
and may be privileged. The 
information is intended for the 
use of the addressee only. If you 
are not the addressee, please note 
that any disclosure, copying, 
distribution, or use of the 
contents of this message is 
prohibited. 

Original message from "Rich Kahn" < 

As per Mr. Epstein's instructions I will be sending a wire in the amount of 11,666.40. 

EFTA00775363



Please confirm receipt. 

Thank you. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

tel 

fax 646-350-0954 

cell 

From: Martin Weinberg [mailto 
Sent: Tuesday, May OS, 2009 8:31 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: Confidential 

Rich 

My legal invoice for the April 1-30, 2009 period. I will send Jeffrey a copy for his review as well. 
Thanks 

Martin Weinberg 

---- Original Message 

From: Rich Kahn 

To: Martin Weinberg 

Sent: Friday, April 03, 2009 9:30 AM 

Subject: RE: Confidential 

I will be sending a wire this morning. 

Please confirm receipt. 

Thank you. 

Rich Kahn 

EFTA00775364



HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

tel 

fax 646-350-0954 

cell 

From: Martin Weinberg [mailto: 
Sent: Thursday, April 02, 2009 5:11 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: Confidential 

Rich 

Attached is an invoice for legal services for the Jan-March period as detailed. I will send a copy 
to Jeffrey as well for his review. Thanks. Marty 

---- Original Message 

From: Rich Kahn 

To: Martin Weinberg 

Sent: Tuesday, January 20, 2009 10:42 AM 

Subject: RE: Confidential 

Thank you 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

tel 212-327-0131 

fax 646-350-0954 

From: Martin Weinberg [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, January 20, 2009 9:34 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: Confidential 

EFTA00775365



received on 1-16-09, thanks 

--- Original Message ---

From: Rich Kahn 

To: Martin Weinberg 

Sent: Thursday, January 15, 2009 3:25 PM 

Subject: RE: Confidential 

Wire will be sent tomorrow for attached invoice 

Please confirm receipt of funds 

Thanks 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

tel 212-327-0131 

fax 646-350-0954 

From: Martin Weinberg [mailto: 
Sent: Friday, January 09, 2009 1:05 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Darren Indyke (AOL) 
Subject: Confidential 

Rick 

Attached is an invoice for legal fees. A copy has been separately emailed to Jeffrey 

Martin G. Weinberg, Esq. 
20 Park Plaza, Suite 1000 
Boston, MA 02116 
617-227-3700 

cell 

This Electronic Message contains 

EFTA00775366



information from the Law Office of 
Martin G. Weinberg, P.C., 
and may be privileged. The 
information is intended for the 
use of the addressee only. If you 
are not the addressee, please note 
that any disclosure, copying, 
distribution, or use of the 
contents of this message is 
prohibited. 
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