
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

To: Cecile de Jongh 

Subject: Re: Fw: Fw: Contract for Mindshift in January, 2011 

Date: Wed, 13 Oct 2010 19:15:07 +0000 

sorry , please wait 

On Wed, Oct 13, 2010 at 8:58 PM, Cecile de Jongh < wrote: 
May I go ahead with the contract? 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected from 
disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

 Forwarded Message ---
From: Cecile de Jongh c 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationegmail.wm>
Sent: Wed, October 13, 2010 10:59:45 AM 
Subject Re: Fw: Contract for Mindshift in January, 2011 

BTW, is it OK to sign the contract with the hotel? It was due on Monday and we may lose the 
rooms. 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected from 
disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@qmail.com>

To: Cecile de Jongh < 
Sent Tue, October 12, 2010 5:17:34 PM 
Subject Re: Fw: Contract for Mindshift in January, 2011 

i need to see a list of people „ you know how i feel about spouses 

On Tue, Oct 12, 2010 at 9:54 PM, Cecile de Jongh < 
Jeffrey, 

wrote: 
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Darren wanted me to send this to you to make sure that you are okay with these numbers. This is 
for the "Mindshift" meeting (Al Seckel) in January. 

 Forwarded Message ----
From: Cecile de Jon h < 
To: Darren Indyke < 
Sent: Tue, October 12, 2010 3:30:50 PM 
Subject: Fw: Contract for Mindshift in January, 2011 

Highlights of the contract: 

• Name of Event Mindshift 
• Dates January 7-11, 2011 
• Attendees 32 (Spouses) 
• Rooms 16 
• Room Rate $599.00 
• Initial Deposit $12,814.61 due 10/11/10 
• Total for Rooms $45,114.88 
• Total due by November 7, 2010 
• Function fees Waived 
• Cancel Penalty Less than 72 hrs 100%, more than 72 hours 80% 

Sorry, I did not see your earlier email asking for a breakdown. This needs to be signed ASAP. 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected 
from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

 Forwarded Message ----
From: Cecile de Jongh < 
To: Cecile de Jongh < 
Sent: Tue, October 12, 2010 2:57:10 PM 
Subject: Fw: Contract for Mindshift in January, 2011 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected 
from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 
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 Forwarded Messa 
From: Judi Nagelberg 
To: Cecile de Jongh < 
Sent: Thu, September 30, 2010 5:37:59 PM 
Subject: FW: Contract for Mindshift in January, 2011 

Iii Cecile: 

Here is the contract for Mindshift from the Ritz Carlton. 

I know you'll have to forward this to Darren in New York for approval. Note that the contract must be signed by 

October 11th along with an initial deposit of $12,814.61. 

This is similar to the previous contract for ASU. I hope that we don't have delays in signing of the contract, as this is 
peak season and we were fortunate to secure these rooms. 

Let me know if you need anything further. 

Let the games begin!!! 

Warm regards, 

Judi 

Judi Nagelberg 
President 
Island Meetings & Incentives, Inc. 

From: Cameron, Carol [mailto: 
Sent: Thursday, September 30, 2010 3:44 PM 
To: 
Subject: Contract for Mindshift in January, 2011 

Judi, 

Please see attached contract for Mindshift group in January of 2011. Please review and let me know if there are any corrections or 
revisions. I've also included a credit card authorization form for their convenience. If they prefer to do a wire transfer or check, 
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please let me know, and I will be happy to get the appropriate information to you. 

Thanks! 

Warm regards, 

Carol Cameron 

Catering Sales Manager 

The Ritz-Carlton, St. Thomas 

6900 Great Bay 

St. Thomas, VI 00802 

This communication contains information from The Rit-Carhon Bowl Company L,L.C. that may be confidential. &cep: Jar personal we by the intended recipient. or as 
expreisly authorized be the sender. any person who received this information is prohibited firm disclosing. soloing. distributing. and/or using it. lfyou hare receOrd this 
communication in error please immediaretv delete it and aU copies, and pomp& nob& the. endeo Nothing in dos communication is intended to operate as an electronic 
signature tinder applicable law 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeeNS®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

EFTA00778296


