
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: 

Subject: Re: car insurance 

Date: Fri, 15 Oct 2010 02:25:00 +0000 

ok 

On Thu, Oct 14, 2010 at 10:52 PM, < > wrote: 
Jeffrey, 
I am trying to finalize an invoice with Tracy at our insurance office regarding car insurance for the vehicles that where in my 
name last year, that included: Mercedes convertible , Range Rover, Jaguar and St. Thomas White Suburban., since most 
where sold after the renewal by a month and Half, I still owe Tracy some insurance on these cars, 
Since then I had purchased a 2006 mustang for Brooke and 2007 VW beetle for Taylor this year, that was added to the 
policy, 

I have always paid for my personal car insurance separately not to confuse them with my payments of the company 
vehicles that where in my name, with all the adds / deletions and overlap of renewal, it became very confusing to put an 
exact cost of each vehicle according to Tracy. 

May I ask you for assistance and approval, I owe Tracy $6,320.48 which will pay all my car insurance till June 2011. As you 
see in Tracy's email, she only estimated that company cars for that time would have been $519.00 only. this will start a 
clean slate regarding what is owed for my car insurance in the future. 
Sincerely, 
Larry 

Jeffrey, 
just a personal note, the reason I purchased a car fa this year for her 16th birthday, 
she's having a tough time at school with friends, no one is able to sleep over our house, and had invited two 

friends to visit her at the ranch this summer, one parent bluntly said no, and blamed my employmen ,. I know this is not your 
problem, personally I don't care what over parents say about me. but wanted to share it with you, she has one more year 
of high school remaining, then she's off to collage, 
then I contemplate moving,. 
thank you again, 
Larry 

Hi Larry 

Okay, I will do my best. Because there were so many changes to the policy with adding, removing and replacing cars it became a 
little complicated. 

For the couple plus months that the '05 Mercedes CLK, '08 Land Rover, 'OS Jaguar X-Type and '99 Chevy Suburban were insured, 
the best I could calculate is owed would be $519.00 

Currently, the balance still due for your auto policy is $6,320.48 

If you should need any additional information, please let me know. 

Kindest Regards, 

Tracy (Penwell 
Personal Accounts 
Insurance Office of Central Ohio 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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Jeffrey Epstein 
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