From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(wgmail.com=
To: Emad Hanna ~_
Subject: Re: PR Palm Trees
Date: Mon, 13 Sep 2010 13:45:24 +0000

why would you wire the full amount,, what happens if they don:t come through///?

On Mon, Sep 13, 2010 at 9:33 AM, Emad Hanna fi_ wrote:

Jeffrey,

Just to give you the heads up we are wiring $ 30,975 for the 135 trees in order to get the process started ASAP.

Thank you

Emad Hanna

Project Controller
HERK Associates

PO Box 488

New York, NY 18158
Cell
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-chent privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationf@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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