From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationf@gmail.com>
To: Emad Hanna ﬂ_‘f
Subject: Re: L8] Master Suite Marble
Date: Tue, 17 Aug 2010 18:09:54 +0000

ok

On Tue, Aug 17, 2010 at 12:01 PM, Emad Hanna f_} wrote:

Jeffrey,

I forgot to mention the budget line item for this marble will be over budget by $ 14,302 and Gary said the labor
will be under budget by about $ 8,000 so the net of these two line items will be over budget by $ 6,000

Thank you

Emad Hanna

Project Controller
HBRK Associates

PO Box 488

New York, NY 18158

ph
Fax |
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The information contained mn this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use. disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationfagmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.

EFTAO00779413



