Inflatable Marlin Services L.L.C

1608 5W 3rd ave.
Fort Laudendale, FL 33315

INVOICE
[inuice Date | (oo ] Retail
Warranty.
18- 2016 174 Internal
Estimate: XEx
Bl Te Sarviced By |
ampady b L5J LLC Mame- Sylvio Subotnjicki LL

Indvidual Madre Larry Visaski

Date Recerved:

ure 51. Jarmes Iskand
5t Thomas USVI Daie Compieted:

Adldresg

Product MakeModel  Sportis Inflalables
Description

Endgin it I
Sportis 10500 5 Regiswation §. M
Storm Grey hypalon wwbes 1670 DTX
Air valves 1.pcs
Relsefe preasure valves 7 pos. Senal # Engine 1
Rubrail fin Shark gray tighe
0 rng 20 pes. Engine 2
Men - Skid blatk 16 pes 515, 8:00.00 Senal®  Drve 1
M names Side Drive 2
lnslalation Brtish Virgin sland %2,100.00
Total: £17,500.00 Pmdwl:‘mt

per hw heours

Frame ime 2 o 3 weeks Labor 510 R

Matenals

F imii mileg

Mileasge 40,50 )
| hiwehy authorize the above repair work Lo be done along with the Total wo Tax —
necessary materials. Youw and your employees may operate the unit herein | Sakes Tax
dascribed on any waterways or eliewhers lor purposes of testing, 6.00%
napection, or delivery at my risk. An express mechanic's lien i
acknowledged on above unil 1o secure the amount of repairs Lthereta. 1T is _
also understood that Mriin Yacht inflatables, inc. wall not be held TOTAL m 00
responsible for the loss or damage to the unit for article left in or with the
umnit) in case af fire, theft, accident, inclement weather conditions or any P, s Credil
other cause beyand our control, ]
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M Gmall Daphne Wallace <[ NG

Sportis tubes

Daphne Wallace < > Tue, Sep 13, 2016 at 4:35 PM
To: Rich Kahn < >

Confirmed.

On Sep 13, 2016 5:30 PM, "Richard Kahn" <[ NG v ot<:

please confirm you received my email with invoice and send check in next package for
50%
thanks

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

te

fa

C

On Sep 13, 2016, at 8:30 AM, Daphne WEHEC_
wrote:

Greetings Rich,

Is there an understanding of the scope of work between LSJ and Silvio. Do
you know what the 50% deposit is supposed to be, or am | supposed to ask
him?

On Mon, Sep 12, 2016 at 6:17 PM, Daphne Wallace

> wrote:

Forwarded message ------—--—-

From: "Silvester Subotnjicki"* < G -
Date: Sep 12, 2016 7:14 PM

Subject: Re: Sportis tubes

To: "Daphne Wallace" <
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M Gmai Daphne Wallace < EN -

Fwd: new tubes Pictures of Sportis

Richard Kahn < > Tue, Sep 13, 2016 at 9:18 AM
To: Daphne Wallace < =

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
tel
fa

ce

Begin forwarded message:

From: Larry Visoski *-'-_}

Subject: Re: new tubes Pictures of Sportis
Date: July 22, 2016 at 3:06:31 PM EDT
To: Richard Kahn
Cc: ann rodriquez <

=
>, Carlos Rodriguez

Rich,

Just spoke to Silvio,,

inflatable Marlin Services, LLC
$16k approved!

$16k plus his travel and lodging expense is agreed by Silvio. With following conditions: |
hope are acceptable to you?

|
1- install Labors will be himself Plus 1 helper, he asked if the boat could be out of water in
protected / Dry area for tube install? "Large tent or Tarp?

2- Also, he needs 2 helper guys to assist with install to hold tubes in place? For a couple
of hours.

Silvio asked if LSJ is capable of removing the old tubes, since he needs these properly
removed for re-manufacturing of the new tubes,. or he is willing to Travel to LSJ to
remove tubes, takes 1 day at most to remove the tubes properly.

Rich,

do You and Carlos want to speak direct to Silvio?

He is amending his invoice and will provide new one shortly for your approval.
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Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 22, 2016, at 1:29 PM, Richard Kahn < || > v ote:

larry can you please call vendor and offer him 16k for materials and labor
we will also pay all travel expenses

do you know specifics of tubes or shall we patch in carlos once we come to
terms with silvio on pricing?

please advise

thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
tel
fa

ce

On Jul 18, 2016, at 10:48 PM, Larry Visoski <[ Gz wrote:
Jeffrey and Anna,

Per your request, please find attached price quote for New Tubes for
Sportis boat,,

Marlin Inflatables / Silvio (owner) is the person that is installing new
tubes on the Nautica boat,,

Silvio and his team are well-versed on travel installations and willing
to travel to St. Thomas for this install.,

Silvio would like us to ship the old tubes from sportis so he could
make silhouette exact copies of current tubes.

Quote attached for Jeffrey's review.

Than you,
Larry

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:
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LSJE, LLC

inflatable Marlin Services LLC 9M14/2018

FirstBank Operating C

L

INV. 374: 50% Deposit - Sportis tube repairs—

INV. 374: 50% Deposit - Sportis tube repairs

102ad

3212

8,000.00

8,000.00
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