Wire Confirmation

The wire transfer request below has been transmitted successfully.

Transmitted:  02/07/2018 12:39:59 PM (ET)
Transmitted By: BELLAKLEIM

Recipient Effective Confirmation Approval
Account Template Name Name Amount | Currency Date Number Status
E-EEEJQ% LLC -DDA- II_SJE to Radyca |RADYCA, INC | 150,000.00 | USD 0200772018 | 3226913966 1 of 1 received
nc
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From

¢ jelrey E. jeevacabond gmal cam

Subject:

Date
To

fPE

: February 8, 2018 at 8:41 PM

. Fichard Ko (N 2on ~iovso [N

rich send ramon 150k bill for past , work , sitll to be completed and the

30 percet of movning forwrard thx

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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From
Subject
Dale

T

Cec

: Ramon Alunn—
: Re:

: Fabruary 6, 2018 at 8:21 PM

: jeffrey E. jsevacation@gmail.com

: Rlchard Kahn

Will do; Melina will send all the information to Richard.

Thank you very much for coming yesterday and hope to see you again

soon.
Regards,

Ramon Alonso

RADYCA

On Feb 6, 2018, at 5:51 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com=>
wrote:

please send rich the bill and the contract

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

including all attachmenis. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA00799069



From: jeffrey E. jeevacation@gmail.com
Subject: Re: Radyca

Date: February 7, 201 :
To: Richard Kahr

agreed

On Wed, Feb 7, 2018 at 11:10 AM, Richard Kahn

< wrote:

| will send 150,000 wire now

there invoices are made out to JEGE LLC

not sure if deliberate but was thinking this should be paid from LSJE
LLC and invoices should be the same

please advise

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: Melina Brito <:—>

Subject: RE:
Date: February 7, 2018 at 10:05:36 AM EST
To: Richard Kahn <
Cc: Ramon Alonso <

>

Dear Richard,

Please find attached contract and invoices.
Don’t hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.

EFTA00799070



Best,

Melina Brito
Office Manager

IR ADYCA

1450 Brickell Ave.
Suite 2190
Miami Fl. 33131

WV Y A c 11

Ihits c-mail, and sy atachments thercto, is inended only for wse by the addresseets) mamed herein and ey comain feeally privileecd
amlior confidential inlormation. This e-mail and wm avtached doguments coniam in fommntion which is PRIVILECG] D, PROPRIFTARY aml
CONFIDENTIAL. are protected by the Elecuronic Communications Privitcy Act, 18 US.C Sections 2510-2521, Federal and State copvri
taws. and are inended only for the use of the addresseels) named herein.  IF you are et the inended recipient, of s -mailvoi ane
noted that any dissemmation, distribution or copying of this e-mail. aid any attachments thereto, is sirictly profibited, 1] yim fiave
recgived this e-mai in emmor, pleise mmedinteh nedify me mt I86 502 4543 1o permanently delete the origiml and am o of sy sl
and wy printout Tsered

From: Ramon Alonso
Sent: Tuesday, February 06, 2018 8:22 PM

To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation @gmail.com>
ce: Richard kahn < I

Subject: Re:

Will do; Melina will send all the information to Richard.
Thank you very much for coming yesterday and hope to see You again soon.
Regards,

Ramon Alonso

IRADY CA

On Feb 6. 2018, at 5:51 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

please send rich the bill and the contract
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IR ADY CA

INVOICE

Date Invoice #
1450 BRICKELL AVE 2/5/2018 250
STE 2120
MIAMI, FL 33131
Bill Te
LSJE, LLG
Project
201724-LSJ & GSJ
Item Description Rate Amount
Design Fees LAND SURVEYING MAPS PHASE 25,000.00 10,000.00
Design Fees ARCHITECTURAL AS-BUILT DRAWINGS 15,000.00 £,000.00
Design Fees DRONME & PHOTOGRAPHIC SERVYICES 36,000.00 14,400.00
Travel Expenses TRAVEL EXPENSES 3,600.00 1440.00
Total $31,840.00
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[RADY CA

1450 BRICKELL AVE

STE 2120

MIAMI, FL 33131

Bill To

LSJE, LLC

INVOICE

Date

Invoice #

21572018

iy

Project

201724-L8J & G3J

Item

Description

Rate

Amount

Design Fees

Design Fees

Design Fees

ARCHITECTURE
- CONCEPTUAL DIAGRAMS - CONCEPT

DESCRIPTION - CONCEPT SKETCHES -

- ILLUSTRATIVE SITE PLAN FOR ALL STRUCTURES -

CIRCULATION DIAGRAMS ON ALL LEVELS

- SCHEMATIC FLOOR PLANS INCLUDING
CIRCULATION CONCEPTS -SCHEMATIC
ELEVATIONS, SECTIONS

- 3D RENDERING VIEWS PREPARED IN-HOUSE -
CONCEPT DESIGN REFORT

LANDSCAPE

- SITE ANALYSIS DIAGRAMS - CONCEPT
LANDSCAPE PLAN -REFERENCE IMAGE BOARD
- CONCEPTUAL SECTIONS FOR SPATIAL
RELATIONSHIP - PLAN MATERIAL REFERENCE
BOARD - FOUR 3D RENDERINGS

CIVIL

- SITE ANALYSIS FOR ROADWAY, STORM WATER
AND UTILITIES - ROADWAY MASTER PLANNING

- STORM WATER MASTER PLANNING - UTILITY
MASTER PLANNING

208,160.00

140,000.00

24,840.00

62,448.00

42,000.00

7.452.00

Total

$111,900.00
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IR AD>DY CA

INVOICE

Date Invoice #
1450 BRICKELL AVE 12/7/2017 207
STE 2120
MIAMI, FL 33131
Bill To
LSJE, LLC
Project
201724-L5J) & G5
Item Description Rate Amount
Design Fees LAND SURVEYING MAPS PHASE 25,000.00 15,000.00
Design Fees ARCHITECTURAL AS-BLILT DRAWINGS 15,000.00 9,000.00
Design Feas DROMNE & PHOTOGRAPHIC SERVICES 36,000.00 21,600.00
Travel Expenses TRAVEL EXFENSES 3,600.00 2,160.00
Total ( $47,760.00
]

e
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[R ADYCA

GREAT SAINT JAMES
LITTLE SAINT JAMES
MASTER CONCEPT DESIGN PHASE

1450 Brickell Ave. Suite #2120, Miami, FL, 33131e Tel, +1 (786) 502-4543
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RADYCA

Fabruary 5™, 2014
Dear Mr. Jefirey Epsiain:

We appreciate the eppartunity to work with you in this exciling project. Our goals are to provide you with design sarvices of
the highest quality and afficiency and to help you accomplish your project's objectives, Initially, you have asked us o provide survey &
digitalization services to document the exdsting site conditions of both istands We now present our proposal for the project's next
Phase: "Master Plan Conceptual Design”,

1 Eales Fees and Charges

The fees below do not include the local licensed Architect or any sub consultants not spacified in this phase.
The fee Is broken down per phase and team members:

PROJECT PHASE TEAM TOTAL FEE PER DURATION (Weeks)
MEMBERS/CONSULTANTS PHASEICONSULTANT
Architectura $208.180 USD
e e P! Tangscaps §140,000 USD 13
Chvil £24 840 USD
Schematic Design Fans nat } @ wll e dlatieTrnad wilh chant upon master glan dolson and appse]
Design Development Fives nat nchucied and will be glenmaned wih Ghet upon masiar plan deinlion and aperoral
Construction Documenis Fous nat inchced! and wil e deterTnad wah chent upon masier Far dufiion 3 apora
Consiruciion Administration P et wocluced and wil b alorrTered Wi cllon upon masior plan defrvlion and approral
- Reimbursable expanses are not Incudod.

* Wi will require & daposi of 0% of the Master Plan Concepiual Diesign fee prior o commence work: the ciant wil be bilad monthiy

2. Scope of Work

Master Plan Conceptual Design includes the aesthetic design of the exterior areas for both islands including overal massing,
finishes, and materials. Interior design is not included in this proposal. The Design Architect will lead and direct the Master Plan
Conceptual Design in collabaration with the Landscape Architect and Civil Enginear.

The scope of work will include an initial overal analysis for both slands. This analyzis will help the Master Plan Conceptual Design
achieve a sensible logistical plan that supparts the activities and interests of the client. The scope of work for each of the disciplines
during this phase is as follows:

SCOPE OF WORK

a)  Identify existing site conditions and features ang prepare drawings for site analysis
b) Review applicable government code requirements, including zoning, city
ordinances, and it requirerments,

MASTER PLAN CONCEPTUAL ¢) Review/analyze Jmlumgr both islands

DESIGN PHASE d) Propose design elements & destinations
8) Prepare drawings ilustrating the concepiual Master Plan
fi Meet with client to discuss and memorialize dacisions from the Master Plan phase
9) Prepare a scaled concept design for design elements and destinations based on

the overall Master Plan concegt

1450 Brickell Ave. Suite #2120, Miami, FL, 33131  Tel +1(786) 502-4543
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[RADYCA

3. Deliverables
PROJECT PHASE TEAM DELIVERABLES
MEMBERS/CONSULTANTS
Architecture a) Conceptual diagrams (2 preliminary allernatives)
B) Concept description
c) Concept skelches
d) llugtrative site plan for all structuras
a) Circulation diagrams on all lavels
f Sehamalic floor plans including circulation concepls
al Schamalic elevations
h) Schematic sections
iy a0 rendering views prepared in-house (as needed)
Master Plan Conceplual D Concept design report
Design Landscape a) Site analysis diagrams
b} Concept landscape plan
) Raference image board (mood board)
d) Concepiual sections for spalial relationship
a) Plant material reference board
j] Four (4) 3D renderings
Civil a) Site analys's for roadway, storm water and utilities
b) Roadway masier planning
c) Storm water master planning
d) Utility master planning

- Dellverables are for bolh Great St James & Litlie 5t James

4. Externgl Consultants

We will advise you of proposed staffing assignments involving other consultants and will work with you to decide on the
staffing most appropriate to meet your needs and expectations. Ve will be subcontracting and warking closely with other
professionals, as the project requires, such as, Wind Engineer, Local Architect, Mechanical Engineer, Electrical Enginesr, Plumbing
Engineer, Structural Engineer, Environmental consultant, Topographer, or any olher specially consultarts Their fees are not included

in this phase

5. Addilions] Servi

The proposed fee is exclusive of expenses incurmed in connection with our work, Such as lravel expenses We do nol make
a profit on our reimbursable expensesicharges. We do, however, recovar our direct and allocable indirect costs.
Any additional services bayond the scope of work, will be billed at an hourly rate; prior client approval. Reimbursable expenses will be

billed at cost.

HOURLY RATES
| Principal $450.00
Agsociate Director $250.00
Project Manager $180.00
Designer $100.00
Administrative $80.00

1450 Brickell Ave. Suite #2120, Miami, FL, 313111e Tel. +1 (786) 502-4543
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IR ADYCA

6  Temms and Conditions

During the course of this phase. we may express opinions or beliefs about the efectivaness of certain design andfor
construction proposals or about the results that might be anlicipated. Such siatements are expressions of apinion and exparience only,
and should not be constructed as promises or guarantias.

Should this proposal meet your approval, you may accepl the terms and conditions attached hereto by refuming 2 signed
copy fo our office, aleng with a retainer in the amount of $111,800 USD. We wil commence providing the requested services prompltly

upon recaipt

Wi look farward to conlinue collaborating with you on this project. It is an @xciting site which offers many challenges and possibilities.

Kind regards,

Ramon Alonso
President

1450 Brickell Ave. Suite #2120, Miami, FL, 33131e  Tel, +1 (786) 502-4543
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[R ADY CA

PROPOSED TEAM MEMBERS - MASTER PLAN STAGE TEAM:

» Design Architect
e Landscape Architect

+ Civil Engineer

COMPLETE TEAM:
_| Landscape Architect
Iaria Schyetnan I 1
Environmental Eng. VegetationCons.

(TBD) rag

| | CivilEng.

Dervid Taydor
Interior Designer
RADYCA
Design Architect 1 Local Architect
Rarman Alonso (TEO) I I 1
Stiwctural Eng. Specinities MEP Eng,

(TEDY Tao; iTBDN

- Wtr]_dé;l;n Lightmg Cansalient I

- Cinera Cosmyitant
S0l Cangultant
Topography
Ryt Wiahart —1 . -"u-fh:u wedan
Geotechrical Erg. - BHCUNTy

mam «Kikghen

D Consultants included in this phase

1450 Brickell Ave. Suite #2120, Miami, FL, 33131e  Tel. +1(786) 502-4543
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IR ADYCA

A ECT: YCA = Al MO ONSO
"A glabal design sam ingpired by creativity and innovation™

With over 20 years of experience in tha design industry. bullding a portfolio of projects of diverse
typalogy that capture a refined and sophisticaled definition of luxury, Ramon Alonsa is President
and lead designer of RADYCA, an international design firm offering architecture, design and
construclion administration services. He co-founded Loguer Design where he acted as Managing
Director for over 12 years. Since the 90's Ramon has collaborated in multiple intermatonal
museums and pavilions and has directed the design and execufion of several large-scale
commercial projects, custom residences, private aircrafts and superyachts. He is the first Mexican
designer to win a World Superyacht Award, being nominated finalist an three eccasions. His work
includes the conceptualization and design development of “CMX" Cinemnas at Bricksll City Cenlre
and "The Bond" on Brickell among other high-end projects in the cily, as well as in Naw York,
Chicage, Vail, Houston, Mexico and Europe:

SCA RCH H -

GDU is an internationally recognized Landscape design fim, founded in 1977. The interdisciplinary
staff of 22 architects, engineers, and landscape architects is based in Mexico City, and works on
projects primarily in Mexico and the South of the United States with vast axperience in the
Carbbean. Design leader Mario Schjetnan, Director of GDU, has a background both in architectura
and landscape architecture, as well as in urban planning. GOU works at all scales — ranging from
large-scale planning and urban dasign to the detailed design of public and private open spaces.
Mario Schjetnan is ane of the founding architects and landscape architects at GDU. His work
fealures prominent ecological restorafion projects, including Xochimilco Ecological Park which
received The Green Prize in Urban Design from Harvard University and Chapultepec Park,
Mexico's largest and most important park. which won awards from the American Sociaty of
Landscape Architects and the Mexican Biennale of Archilecture for environmental, historic,
landscape and hydraulic restoration. Mr. Schietnan’s work has also been publighad in intemaltional
Dooks, journals, and magazines, Schjetnan finds inspiration in the qualities of the emvironments in
which he works: the climate. botany and topography of the sites, the malerials and building
techniques of specific regions

IVIL ENGINEER: IS C ENGINEERS - DAVID TAY|

Harnis Civil Engineers (HCE) is a full service civi engineering design firm with a commitment to
craalive and innovative design sclutions. HCE has a long history of leadership and financial
strangth. HCE was established in 1986 in Orands, Florida, The firm began with majer office and
retail prejects in Qriando. Those projects led o many other Central Florida projects including theme
parks and resort hotels. In 1993 the firm began its first preject in the Bahamas, which led to work
throughout the Caribbean. Today, the firm has extensive experience with complex muli-consultant
projects located around the world. Some of these projects include: The Allantis Resort in the
Bahamas, Ocean Club in Paradise Island, Baha Mar Resort in Cabls Beach, Four Seasons in
Great Exuma, Ritz Carlton in Rose lsland, Ritz Carftan in St. Thomas, American Yacht Harbor in St
Thomas, Muller Bay in 5L Thomas, aio.

1450 Brickell Ave. Suite #2120, Miami, FL, 33131®  Tel, +1 (786) 502-4543
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RADY CA

LITTLE ST. JAMES - 72 Acres

L1560} Brickall Ave Suite 87 120, Miami, FL, 1iL3le fel +L(786) 5024543
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RADY CA

GREAT §T. JAMES = 162 Acres
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[RAD>Y CA

Terms and Conditlons:

Copyright: Designs produced at the reguest of the cliant are done with (he knowledge ihat the client inlends 1o axeculs the dessgn with Radyca. ING Al
rapaors, plans and studies and analyses, models, and ofher wark products or deliverables ("Design Documents”) will be delivered o thoe clierit par the
agresment. Wilh respect to the Design Documents. Radyca, INC agroas and doas hereby grant 1o the client an exclusive royally-free liconse 10 use of
such documents far the progect oullined abowe only Subject o he fregoing grants of use and ownership, Radyca, INC shall be desmed B author and
awner of its respeciiva Instrumants of Sance, including the Drawings and Spedfications, and shall relan all comman law, statutory and othar deserved
nights, pertaining bo intallactual property, mcluging copynghts associated with such authorshe The client agress {hat Radyea, INC. shall haw the nghts ko
take pholographs of the fnshed “Project” and use them in Radyca, INC. own marketing, webaite and promotional materal Radyca, INC shall be given
reasonable access to the completed project lo make such representations. However, Radyea, INC. material shall not include THE OWMER'S confideritial
of peoprietary information Tha design cannot be executed or madified without the paricipation of Radyca, INC Should the project or this agieement be
terminalad for any reason at all, the canse granted above will be revoked by Radyca. INC and the Client wil not be able (o use the work o the
daliverables in amyway

Fagg. The fees for Radyca, INC. Archieclural wmmdabamdmummmmnwmammmhﬂw

Should Ihe size. scope of services oulside those described, complesaly, design schedule or consliuction budget change, the fea Agreament will requne
adjustment, All paymenls must be in US Dollars W will require a deposit of 30% of the Master Plan Conceptual Design fae prior to commence the work
The Cliznt will be billed monthly

Taxes: Fees presenied above are excusive of all laxes. Sarvice tax, VAT and any olher local laxes are nol inchuded.

Reimbureabls Expenges: A8 oul of pockel xpanses shal o previously approved by the CBant. Out of pocket axpenses will be invoiced al cost, and will
inciude. *Printing, ploting, presentation models, rendarings and repreduction of documents. «Travel and holel accommadalion expenses B it of bown
iravel Ramaon Alkansc iravels in Business class and Associates travel in Econcmy class 'Expanses associated with phalography “Messenger and couier
mﬁﬂm@ﬂmﬂ-cwdmmsmmwmmwmmn Radyca, INC The fee does nol inchude the

NﬂwmmﬁngMIWH All rendarings, animalions, models made by oulside eaneutants will be billed al cost plus 20% coordination fee for
Redyca, INC work

Temminatign, This Lesier Agreameni may be jgrminated by elher parly upon nol lese than seven (7) days writien nabce should the othar pary Gail
substaniially to parform in accordance wilh the teems of (his Lalmﬁummmﬂmhmhulnfmemlnimh!emmatinn,hm'ﬁm.m
party shall have the night to terminate his Leiler Agreemant, withoul cause, upan thirty (30) doys prior withen notica o the ather party Failure of the
Chenl to make payments fo the Architect i accardance wilh thes Letter Agreament shel be considered substanlial nonperformance and cause for
iaeminaticn. In the svenl of iarminalion, the Architec! shall be compensated for servicos performad pricr ko lermanation, togethar with Reimbursable
Expenses then due. In the event of terminaton of this Leber Agresment for any reason, the Clent shall nol ulikze any of the project, concepls, wark
produced, of dasign documants or the name of “Ramon Alonsg” andlor “Radyca NG, whather directly or indirecily for any purposa in connection with

the Project

Lisbility: Radyes INC. agress Lo ndemnify the Client against damages, which have cccurred as 8 rasull of (he negligance of s kability, in the ajgregate. ia
up to 8 maximum lotal of 50% of Radyca INC. Design fee as cullined in thes latiar agreemant.

Howaver, he Cliant agraes that under no circumstances shell any ciaims assertad-by the Client against Radyea, INC. result in any Eability on the part of
Radyca, INC. in axcess of ihe limilabions on liabilty as set fodh above, mw-;.huarm-mﬂmn.mmm In addition.
mmmwwmmmmmmmd by law, no officer, director, sharsholder, partner, principal, fiducary, employes ar
ather representative of eilher Radyca, INC. or i Clignt shall have parsonal labiity under any provision of this Agreamant or for any matier in connaction
with thiz sarvices providad for the Project Radyca, ING is not responsible to the Client or any fhird-paries for amors, omissions or ather deficiencies in
I services of the consullants retained by he Clisnt Radyca, INC. or any olher design profissional

Confidgntiality Radyca, INC. and the Client henety covanant and agree (hal, except as requined by law, thay wil not disclose the terms and conditions
of this Lettar Agreement to any ofher persan o¢ enlily without obtainng ihe prior written consant for the othar party herato o such a dscloswe,

Notwithstanding the foregaing, Radyea, INC. and the Client acknowladge and agres thal Radyca, INC. and the Cliant will have a right o disclose he
axistance of the Letler Agreemant and the names dh&pﬂﬂﬂarﬂﬂmmsﬁﬂMhmmmmﬁmhlrm. consulkants,
governmental authonties and catin utrunlulruganmasmwbummumnqrﬂuMuurdumuiﬂgm“dbpumrmmmmmm. under Tis
LeraMﬂmMmﬁwmsﬂuﬂmmm”lwhan

Wmisuwﬂnmmwllmanumwmamum in accordance with the kaws of the Uniled Sistes of Amenca.
Each party hersby expressly and irevocably accepts and subemits i Ihe jurisdiction and venue of the courts of (he State of Florida,

Entire Agregmeni. Agreemant, This Letler Agresmant along with our attached proposal represents e enfire and inlegrated agreament batwaen the
Clhent and the Architect, This Lefier Agreement may be amendad only by witten insirument signed by bath the Client and the Architect.

Accepted on Bahalf of Chant by:

Mpma:
Tithe:
Sigrature.

1450 Brickell Ave. Suite #2120, Miami, FL, 33131e  Tel. +1 (786) 502-4543
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