

Statement

Tonja Haddad, PA
 Advocate Building
 315 SE 7th Street
 Suite 301
 Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

Statement Date:	Statement No.
9/29/2017	858
Terms	Due Date
NET 10 days	10/9/2017

Bill to

Darren Indyke
 Jeffrey Epstein
 575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
 New York, New York 10022
 United States

Case Name	PO No.	Billing Type	Rate
Rothstein Edwards Litigation		Retainer - Hourly	425.00

			Amount
Total hours:		74.50	31,662.50
Work Hours			
Date	Description	Hours	
8/25/2017	Teleconferences with client and co-counsels.	1.00	
8/25/2017	Communications regarding depositions. Review pleadings from Scarola- respond to same and send to co-counsels.	0.60	
8/26/2017	Review and respond to communications from co-counsels and counsel for witness.	0.50	
8/28/2017	Multiple communications and correspondence iwth co-counsels and opposing counsel regarding discovery and dates and deadlines; schedule Motion.	2.00	
8/29/2017	review documents from DKI. Revise Discovery requests. Communications with opposing counsel regarding hearing and discovery.	3.10	
8/30/2017	Teleconference with co-counsels. Review and respond to communications with co-counsels and opposing counsel.	1.00	
9/2/2017	Communications with Mr. Scarola and client.	1.20	
9/5/2017	Finalize discovery requests to Edwards and serve same.	4.20	

Work Hours

Date	Description	Hours
9/6/2017	Prepare for and attend hearing on Motion to Set SJ date. Communications with co-counsels regarding same.	3.60
9/12/2017	Review communications from co-counsel.	0.20
9/14/2017	Receive and review Edwards's Motion to Strike Motion for SJ. Communicaitons with co-counsel and opposing counsel regarding same.	2.50
9/15/2017	Peclare for and attend hearing. Multiple communications with co-counsels.	6.80
9/16/2017	Review all documents served by the Court and opposing counsel on Friday. Review discovery responses.	2.50
9/18/2017	Review and respond to multiple communications. Depoition and hearing issues.	4.50
9/19/2017	Multiple communications with co-counsels. Conduct research regarding seeking documents under seal. Conduct additional research and revise Motions in Limine. Review documents from Scarola; communications with co-counsels regarding same.	7.20
9/20/2017	Continue researching and writing pretrial motions.	7.10
9/21/2017	Conduct research and draft pretrial motions.	9.20
9/25/2017	Revise and finalize motions. Review NOA and New Motions Filed by Edwards. Communications with co-counsels and client regarding same.	3.80
9/26/2017	Review and respond to communications. Revise and draft Motions.	3.10
9/27/2017	Communications with co counsels and opposing counsels. Work on Motion responses.	3.50
9/28/2017	Revise and file Motions. Continue drafting additional reesponses. Review and respond to communications from counsel.	4.10
9/29/2017	Review and revise documents and send to co-counsels. Communications with DKI and co-counsels.	2.80
Total hours:		74.50

Expenses

Date	Description	Tax
9/29/2017	Palm Beach Court Reporting- two appearances	0.00
Total expenses:		Subtotal

148.90

148.90

Amount 31,662.50**Subtotal** 31,811.40**Total Due** 31,811.40