
29101/2019 Mail — 

EPSTEIN / Fees (as from January 1st, 2019) 

Marie-Joseph Experton 

To:EPSTEIN - INDYKE Darren 

knpottance: High 

Dear Darren, 

OO

Further to our telephone conversation of yesterday, this message concerns my fees (since we did not renew our 
agreement for 2019). 

Please confirm that you agree on the following for all the work done for and in relation with Mr. Epstein, 
as from January 1st, 2019. 
Fees are to be invoiced on a time spent basis for all services rendered since January 1st 2019 based on the 
following conditions: 

• hourly rate of 220 euros/hour, and 
• if appropriate, 220 euros as lump sum amount for expenses relating to special trip to Paris. 

NB: see my separate message regarding the services to be rendered as from now. 

Best regards. 

Marie-Joseph Experton 
Avoca, au Bantam de Paris eiabli d Bnaelles 
avenue Louise 150 
1050 Brtucelles 
Belgique 
Tel. +32 2 538 58 80 
Fax +32 2 538 58 88 
GS 

Cabinet Experton spri 
Numero TVA : BE 0860.831.646 

From: Marie-Joseph Experton 
Sent 15 January 2019 16:18 
To: EPSTEIN - INDYKE Darren 
Subject: EPSTEIN / Fees (recap extra 2018) - payment 

Payment of 3,406E received for the 2018 extra work and disbursement. Thank you and best regards. 

Marie-Joseph Experton 
Avoca: au Barreau de Paris itabli r/ Bruxelles 
avenue Louise ISO 
1050 Bruxelles 
Belgique 
Tel. +32 2 538 58 80 
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29/01/2019 

Fax +32 2 538 58 88 
GSM 

Mail —

Cabinet Experton sprl 
Namara TVA : BE 0860.831.646 

From: Marie-Joseph Experton 
Sent: 11 January 201918:18 
To: EPSTEIN - INDYKE Darren 
Subject: EPSTEIN / Fees (recap extra 2018) + tcf for 2019 renewal 

Further to our exchanges of December 19th, please find attached the last invoice for the year 2018 with the legal 
documentation required by applicable regulation. 

Do not hesitate to call me if you need more explanations on this invoice. 

NB: this does not cover any of the payments made through my own personal account for Paris apartment utility 
bills. 

I propose that we have a telephone conversation early next week to discuss the conditions of the 2019 renewal 
(sorry I was unable to send you the mail for discussion yesterday because of a meeting I had to attend). Please 
provide availability. 

Best regards. 

Marie-Joseph Experton 
Avocat au Barreatt de Paris etabli a Bruxelles 
avenue Louise 150 
1050 Bruxclks 
Belgique 

Tel. +32 2 538 58 80 
Fax I-32 2 538 58 88 
GSM 

Cabinet Erperton sprl 
Alumina TVA : BE 0860.831.646 
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