Re: EPSTEIN / Mme Peres "gardienne" - SDC 22 AVENUE
FOCH 75116 PARIS

jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Tue 17/10/2017 10:56

ok, butisthere a new person?

On Tue, Oct 17, 2017 at 10:53 AM, Marie-Joseph Experton «’._:- wrote:

See attached full report sent to Darren about your concern relating to Mrs Peres and the lack of
concierge at 22 avenue Foch.

Decision to be made to give Mrs Peres, 45,000 € as extra compensation (for leaving job and
premises) on the top of:

(1) the legal compensation amounting to 31,658 € and

(i1) muscellaneous amounts such as compensation for paid vacation, prorata of the 13th month of
salary, for approximately 4,500 €.

Total cost for all the owners: +/~ 81.500 € (in the range of 12% of this amount for vou: +/- 10,000

€).

The owner of the apartment below yours (representing approximately 16%) agreed last night for
the extra amount.

Please advise.

Best regards.

Marie-Joseph Experton

Avocat au Barreau de Paris établi g Bruxelles
avenue Lowise 137 boite 6

1050 Bruxelles

Belgzique

Cabinet Experton spri
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Numéro TVA : BE 086(L.831.646

From: Darren Indyke <[} -

Sent: 13 October 2017 17:00
To: Marie-Joseph Experton
Subject: Privileged and Confidential

Good day, ML 1 haven't spoken with you in quite some time. [ hope vou are well.

I just heard from Jeffrey that there 1s still no concierge at Avenue Foch. Jeffrey asked me to send you a note so that

vou can follow up with this. Please confirm receipt of this note. Thank vou.

Best,

DARREN K. INDYKE
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, New York 10022
Telephone: (2121 971-1314

Telecopier: (6461 350-0378
Mobile
email:

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended cnly for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
IEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.corm, and
destray this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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