Wire Confirmation

The wire transfer request below has been transmitted successfully. The template created with the transfer request has

been created successfully.

The balances shown below are recorded at the time of the request,

Schedule Information

Confirmation:
Approval status:
Transmitted:
Transmitled by:

Debit Information

Template name:

Account:

Wire type:
Security code:
Send on date:
Amount:
Cumrency:

Recipient Information

Bank ID type:
Bank ID:

Bank name:
Bank address 1:
Bank address 2:
Bank address 3:

Recipient account: (If appropriate enter
the IBAN)

Recipient name:

Recipient address 1:

Recipient address 2:

Recipient addrass 3:

Additional information for recipient:

3313362064

1 of 1 received

09/18/2018 12:05:26 PM (ET)
BELLAKLEIN

LSJE to Xavier Cartron SAS

LSJE, LLC - DDA - 9295 - DBTCA Checking - $419,242 .59
(Balance as of: 09/18/2018 11:58:18 AM (ET) Mot a guarantee of available funds.)

Foreign cumency intemational wire

081872018
30,000.00
EUR

SWIFT

HSBC FRANCE (FORMERLY HSBC CCF)
PARIS

Xavier Cartron SAS
75018 Paris
France

Reference Little Saint James Island

First Intermediary Information

Bank 1D type:
Bank ID:

Intermediary account: (If appropriate
anter the IBAN)

Bank name:

Bank address 1:
Bank address 2
Bank address 3:

EFTA00811875



Second Intermediary Information

Bank ID type:
Bank ID:

Intermediary account: (If appropriate
enter the IBAN)

Bank name:

Bank address 1:
Bank address 2:
Bank address 3:

Wire Initiator Information

Wire initiator nama: Bella Klein

Wire initiator address 1: clo HBRK Associates, Inc

Wire initiator addrass 2: 575 Lexington Avenue,dth Floor
Wire initiator address 3: New York, NY 10022
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From: |effrey E. jsevacation@gmail.com &
Subject: Fwd: LSJ18.41: Little Saint James Island Devalopment
Date: September 17

.
Tor Datren incyke INRRRRNRNNNE. chrc o I

~-==------ Forwarded m
From: Kifah Laham
Date: Mon, Sep 17, 2018 at 4:18 PM

Subject: LSJ18.41: L] ' land Development
To: "jeffrey E."
Cc:
<xcartron@xaviercartron.fr>

-

, Xavier CARTRON

Dear Mr. Jeffrey,

Apologies for the delay.

u (et
i /” B

Please find attached our account details. | / f
/ . y 0
Gﬁﬁﬁ /9 \_)Z (7)13/{9!9

rRegards, ———

el - | -
/z... - \
Kifah Laham QS)[ LLC
Chief Execulive Officer

xavier cartron

PARIS

3. possage Kracher
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75018 PARIS

FRANCE

re: I

‘Web: xaviarcartron.fr

From: jeffrey E. [mailto: jeevacation@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, September 17, 2018 8:00 PM
To: Kifah Laham; “
Subject:

wiring instructions?

please note

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation @gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA00811878



please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

C

xavier cartron

Wiring Instructions

Euro Account

Xavier CARTRON 5AS
HSBC FR CAF SAINT MAUR

IBAN:
BIC:

EFTA00811879



From

: jeffrey E. jeevacation@gmail.com

Subject:

Date
To

: September 17, 2018 al 4:26 PM
: Richard Kah

send 30k euros to kifah

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

jeffrey E. jeevacation®@gmailcom &
Re: LSJ18.41; Linle Saint James Island Development | XC Technical and Financial Propsoal Rev.2
September 1

4 1 03 P
e ahor (RS Fichec e I 0 ke I

On Fri, Sep 14, 2018 at 2:36 PM, Kifah Laham

T

Dear Mr. Jeffery,

| think there is misunderstanding in the terminologies. If you have 5 min, | can call you and
explain.

Thank you,
Kifah Laham

From: jeffrey E. [mailto

Sent: Friday, September 14, 2018 9:26 PM

To: Kifah Laham

Subject: Re: LS]18.41: Little Saint James Island Development | XC Technical and Financial
Propsoal Rev.2

all good except the exemption for any services not included??!
funny . doesnt anyone ever read these things. , |am happy to
work with you , but i dont think we need to consider sewage
treatment plants nearby :)

On Fri, Sep 14, 2018 at 12:29 PM, Kifah Laham
T v

Dear Mr. Jeffery,

Please find attached our revised Technical and Financial Proposal REV.2.

EFTA00811881



We hope this proposal meets your requirements and look forward to receiving your confirmation.

If you have any queries please don't hesitate to contact the undersigned.

Regards,

Kifah Laham
Chief Executive Officer

xavier cartron

PARIS

d.possoge Kracher
75018 PAR

ERANCE

re': [

voo: I
ernc: I

Web: xaviercarron. fr

From: Kifah Laham
Sent: Thursday, September 13, 2018 11:30 AM
To: "jeffrey E.'

Fas Wasdae mARTRAR: A el sm Pl
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Ll AV WMl RUIN, Aaoslya Liauldl

Subject: LS118.41: Little Saint James Island Development

- Dear Mr. Jeffery,

Hope you are well and it was very nice to speak again on Monday.

Thank you for your below email, we will review it and compare if to ours (perimeter of scope and
deliverables) and come back to you by tomorrow regarding our revised proposal.

We assume that the below covers Little Saint James Island Development only and not both Islands.
Flease confirm.

We will do our best to drop our fees to the bare minimum as we are very excited to work together on
your project.

Regards,

. Kifah Laham
Chief Executive Officer

xavier cartron

PARIS

4. possage Kracher

75018 PARIS

EFTA00811883



ERANCE

re: I
woo: [
emai: [

web: goviercariron,fr

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com])

Sent: Wednesday, September 12, 2018 6:28 PM
To: Kifah Laham; h
Subject:

here is a proposal from another firm . so im not sure what to do.

as i think you guys are great but the risk should be shared. |am

happy to pay the same or even double.

please note

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights

Wi L LOE Wl

TR IE ]

AL N Ll LW
-y
e i ]

EFTA00811884



BLI
AL LEWERS
BE AR N SAMT RN

"
1 CONGEFT GBI
ERAEEY
1.1 AACHITECTLMAL 8 TUCHES
LA

 WAS TR PLAdh (S0ALE

A e B AND TS § SRR Ol e T Wi W ENT
o WA TN FLAN (SCALE VoD
o FILOOR PLAMS (MLl 1y
* WM BECTONE AND ELEVATEORTS (SCAQl 1700
v DO MURSESil D PLANS (SCALLD =20l
RN RO R L AMOSCAPRG Pl
o TABLE OF SesTFACEY

1.5 OO0 taets
rmr.-ll.w'tv.a P w1 3
v BbAGH HORISE ARCISTRGTNGAL PG E Y
v AR i FRE T XTT RS AN LAMNDSCARY PdvCil §

AR AR TR P, § a0 3 Amrwmioii
1.3 A0 AfwDs el

I. & '

2 HOLSE VEW A
sl W R

e
NG INCY LDRD - O QL NT Mo 5T

IS AR ETEC TS NTE R L

¥ - FELS, THE DULAERY & RATES
! - COMCEPT OES0M PHASE | 870 6 wERRS
I-OMGITODIONA e 00 020 2 AT0EweEs I
ToTaL B
Pl gl

v COST LSTRMWTONS, BUDGLT
o SRURANCED (EECEFT S AL TY
v THAWTL & ACCORAOWN TR CHANDE %

i - PATMENT
TEEWS O PAVSLNT
P TE e (g b 1Ll A
lfl'\llllil' M [T T li:'..a-r_o. b el TR DG N
PAYMENT K3 . COMCEFT I8 Sa0n CELAVEMY PruksE v s Falok
PAVMENTE T coatatl pRLONCEUWERY PeABED oW FE0OC
TOTAL e bl A

ELWCa EnCL WAT) HATH MO AT el DeteG TART S

EFTA00811885



