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please advise if attached boxes pinto bid on are ok to pay
total cost with fees 21,775

Lot image & details

A pair of Japanese brass-mounted black and gilt lacquer boxes

Account number Date
Sale currency

-\h;,- 2018 USD

Please keep this for your records

Sale

Sale number & date

Lot number

Dimensions (L x Wx H)

Purchase Price (excluding any taxes)

LUXE: Art of Design NO9545 - 20 April 2018 1027 2100 x 22.50 x 16.00 IN 520,000.00

thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

EFTA00812934



Begin forwarded message:

From: Bella Klein ,:—:,
Subject: Fwd: Sotheby's Luxe Art of Design
Date: May 7, 2018 at 2:08:15 PM EDT

To: Richard Kahn </ -

I was contacted by Sotheby's in regards to payment that was received from Pinto in the amount of $21,775 for
Jeffrey purchase of a "Pair Of Japanese Brass- Mounted Black and Hilt Lacquer boxes". Wire can't be applied
to JE account as payment name should match the purchaser name. Payment should be returned to Pinto and

paid from JE. Invoice from Sotheby's is attached. Please advise

Thank vou,
Bella

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Mcarthy, Meghan" <

Subject: Sotheby's Luxe Art of Design

Date: May 7, 2018 at 1:38:58 PM EDT

Dear Bella,

Thank you for chatting.

Please see the attached invoice and a copy of the incoming wire below.

Sincerely,
Meghan

Meghan McCarthy
Post Sale Manager, Post Sale Services

EFTA00812935
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