
From: Nina K.
To: Richard Kahn • 

CC: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: 

Date: Tue, 18 Oct 2016 18:11:28 +0000 

I believe M. Wade spoke with M. Epstein. 
I haven't heard back from their conversation. 
I will check with M. Wade. 

Best, 

Nina Keita 
EMBA Candidate 2017 

On Oct 18, 2016, at 2:09 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

can you please provide an update 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Sep 28, 2016, at 4:08 PM, Nina K. < 

Mr Kahn, 

I will contact M. Wade regarding this issue. 
Thank you. 

Nina Keita 
EMBA Candidate 2017 

wrote: 

On Sep 23, 2016, at 3:29 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
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please advise on repayment of kareem's loan in the amount of 100,000 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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