
From: Richard Kahn
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: LSJ: 2010 Chevy Suburban 
Date: Thu, 03 May 2018 21:45:10 +0000 

insurance went ok and adjustor named leah does want to visit LSJ sometime either next week or week after.. 
since everything was destroyed or discarded she is going to need invoices and pictures of all items 
many of these items (probably 50-70%) are in storage so it will take some searching.. 
agent says i should contact pinto and leah's gallery directly as they should have receipts - thoughts?? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On May 3, 2018, at 5:04 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

we need a bunch of new vehilces - lets buy, how did insurance go? 

On Thu, May 3, 2018 at 4:12 PM Richard Kahn
appears brice not being nice and playing games with anna.. 

Richard Kahn 
FMK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Ann Rodriquez 
Subject: Re: LSJ: 2010 Chevy Suburban 
Date: May 3, 2018 at 3:40:33 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 

wrote: 
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Cc: Cecile deJongh 

Brice called me this afternoon and said that he cant find his keys right now for the LSJ Suburban or TWA 
Suburban and that he needed the truck. 

On my way to Home Depot with Jermaine to purchase items for the office and my home. Brice passed us in 
the Suburban that he claimed he didn't have a key for. I don't have a problem with it. I just don't want to 
deal with all the BS anymore tired and frustrated now because it just doesn't make sense. 

If possible, 
Cecile, 
Can I please have a Job letter so I can go purchase a vehicle of my own since both my vehicles that I 
purchased in June 2017 (Truck & Car) was damaged by Hurricane Irma & Maria in 2017 

Ann R. 

On May 3, 2018, at 2:58 PM, Ann Rodriquez < wrote: 

unable to check the mileage today. Brice called me and said that he cant find his keys right now for 
the LSJ Suburban or TWA Suburban so he need the truck. 

I gave it to him this afternoon 

Ann R. 

On May 3, 2018, at 2:04 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

anna can you also provide mileage on each car 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On May 3, 2018, at 1:59 PM, Cecile de Jongh 

Anna, 

Did we try to file a claim? 

With warm regards, 

> wrote: 
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Cecile 

Sent from my iPhone and misspellings courtesy of iPhone. 

On May 3, 2018, at 12:25 PM, Ann Rodriquez

Hi Rich, 

wrote: 

2010 "LSJ" Chevy Suburban 
Purchased: arrived used from the Palm Beach house on 12/30/2015 
Purchase price: unknown 
Vin#: lgnuldce30ar251129 
Keys: 2 available 
Drivers: Anna, Carlos, Jermaine, Chris, Kamoy 
Purpose: Vehicle for Managers, Boat Captains & Drivers 
History: Damaged by Hurricane Irma & Maria. Busted window, water damage & electrical damages. 
The Suburban is used to pickup contractors, extra guests, packages, groceries & Home Depot Runs 
Dealer: -need to request quote for damages.- (Water damage, electrical issues -console has no power- , 
Brake system, hydraulic system, stereo system, no power windows, rusted frame) 
Interior: water damage but was deep cleaned by splash and dash for immediate use 
Note: still being used at the present moment but drivers are concerned. 
First 7 photos: Present Condition 
Last 4 photos: received after the hurricanes & window was fixed. 
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Ann R. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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