
From: Richard Kahn 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: General II Barge 

Date: Mon, 03 Oct 2016 23:19:26 +0000 

Shall I call vendor tomorrow or have anna and remind them of 1500 round trip price from May 2016 
Please advise 
Thank you 

From: Ann Rodriquez 
Date: Friday, May 13, 2016 at 6:08 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Cc: Richard Kahn < 
Subject: Re: General II Barge 

Hey Bossman, 

I had a meeting today with Mr. Hendrington "Bubbler" owner of the General II. 

I negotiated a new RT price with Mr. Hendrington of $1,500.00 (original price $3,000 RT). He said they can start whenever we're 
ready but first he would like a letter of agreement stating that we (I.S1 or GSJ) would use his vessel "The General II" for the 
remaining 2016 year. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

On May 10, 2016, at 4:44 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

does that mean drop trucks off and then pick up later . 

On Tue, May 10, 2016 at 10:43 PM, Ann Rodriquez 
Yes, 
Thursday we will pickup the Canams and Jet Skies. 

General II would be $3,000 round trip. 

Ann R. 

On May 10, 2016, at 4:35 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

did we clear can ams. did we get prices for general 2 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 

wrote: 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
retum e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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