
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

To: Larry Visoski clia> 

Subject: Re: TECHNICAL ACCEPTANCE 09/27/2016 

Date: Wed, 28 Sep 2016 22:36:16 +0000 

Yes 

On Thu, Sep 29, 2016 at 12:27 AM, Larry Visoski c wrote: 
Jeffrey 
Frank deposit is hard now. See attached. 

Spoke to Frank, he advises the buyer will not pay additional $25k for engines, 
Frank immediately sent me an email with the signed acceptance. 
-frank just informed there is additional delay from Buyer of 24 hours, due to a trace of history from one disc in 
the -219 engine history from last shop visit that has history to Mexicana engine shop from one disc installed, 
Mexicana shop is no longer in Business. 
There are ways around this trace history when something like this happens that Frank is trying to work out,. 

I will speak to Manny in the morning to check if he is still ready to buy and preform if that is ok? 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "SignNow (CudaSign)" 
Date: Se tember 28, 2016 at 9:23:08 PM GMT+2 
To: 
Subject: TECHNICAL ACCEPTANCE 09/27/2016 
Reply-To: 

JSignNow 

Deposit may go hard now 

sent you the attached document "doc00827820160926094213.pdf" using 
SignNow. 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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