
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: 

Subject: Fwd: Magnani 
Date: Fri, 23 Sep 2016 16:44:33 +0000 

Attachments: doc00818720160923091213.pdf 

ok 
 Forwarded message   
From: bellaklein  
Date: Fri, Sep 23, 2016 at 12:40 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Magnani 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Please confirm that i can proceed with payment to Dr Magnani for Wandi. Current invoice is $9,220. I would 
like to let you know that we paid $2,880 in August for her previous visits July 21st - 25th. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: September 23, 2016 at 10:12:16 AM EDT 
To: 

CS 3051c1 
[00:17:c8:25:f3:53] 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA00817399


