
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Joscha 
Date: Wed, 21 Sep 2016 13:29:40 +0000 

Yes 

On Wed, Sep 21, 2016 at 7:12 AM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

Last funding was in January 2016 to Joscha from enhanced in the amount of 50,000. Additionally we just sent 
150,000 from enhanced to humanity + and immigration attorney fee for joscha as well. Please confirm 25,000 
is on and that it will also be sent from enhanced to joscha. Thank you. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Joscha Bach
Date: January 6, 2016 at 10:59:18 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Funds arrived 

Richard, thank you, the funds have arrived! 
Bests, 

Joscha 
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