
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Fwd: Big N: Subbase Drydock Estimate 851 

Date: Wed, 14 Sep 2016 21:55:17 +0000 

Attachments: Est_851_from_Subbase_thydock_56560.pdf 

 Forwarded message 
From: Ann Rodriquez <I 
Date: Wednesday, 14 September 2016 
Subject: Big N: Subbase Drydock Estimate 851 
To: Rich Kahn -4 >, brice gordon 
Cc: Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com>, Daphne Wallace 

Attached is the quote from Subbase dry dock to remove old Trunion boxes and Rams out of Big N to be 
fabricated and reinstalled. Gene is requesting 50% upfront and then 50% final payment after the work is 
completed. 

He asked that I go over the quote and get back to him by tomorrow so that he's able to fit us into their schedule. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Debra
Date: September 14, 2016 at 3:49:44 PM AST 
To: "-
Subject: Estimate 851 from Subbase Drydock 

Dear Anna: 

Please review the attached estimate. 

Feel free to contact us if you have any questions. 

We look forward to working with you. 

Sincerely, 

Debra Lowry 
Subbase Drydock 
340-776-2078 

< 

EFTA00818274



please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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