
From: Larry Visoski <la> 

To: Je vacation <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: New Escrow 

Date: Sun, 11 Sep 2016 18:40:17 +0000 
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From Claire 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Claire Brugirard
Date: September 11, 2016 at 2:09:51 PM EDT 
To: Darren Ind ke 
Cc: Larry 
Subject: Re: New Escrow 

> 

Dear Darren 

I believe our next step is to review and agree on the draft purchase agreement. 

As per the LOI the purchaser shall provide this draft. 

Has there been any progress with this on your side? 

Many thanks 

Best Regards, 

Claire Brugirard 

From: Darren Indyke 
Sent: Wednesday, September 7, 2016 14:30 
To: Claire Brugirard 
Cc: Larry 
Subject: Fwd: New Escrow 

Claire, 

I have asked AIC to send you a separate confirmation but please see the deposit confirmation from AIC below. 
Plan D, LLC will be the entity that actually takes title to the Aircraft at closing. It is owned by the same owner 
as Thomas World Air, LLC so I had it wire the Deposit to AIC. Thanks. 

Regards, 

EFTA00818531



Darren 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: T Bear
Date: September 6, 2016 at 7:06:30 PM EDT 
To: Darren lndyke < 
Subject: RE: New Escrow 

Hi Darren, 

The deposit was received late this afternoon. This will confirm receipt of a 51,000,000.00 deposit from Plan 
D LLC referencing Sn. 30884. I look forward to working with you again. Thanks! 

Tammi Bear 
Escrow Agent 

AIC Title Service, LLC 
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AIC is excited to announce the addition of an Appraisal Department. Call us for 
all of  your Aircraft Appraisal needs. 

As with any large purchase or loan,  TITLE INSURANCE is available to  protect 
your interest for a one time  premium. 

We carry a $40 Million Bond and an E&O Certificate of $1 Million for  your 
protection. 

This email and any attachments ("Message") may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are 
not the addressee, or if this Message has been addressed to you in error, you are not authorized to read, copy, or 
distribute it, and we ask that you please delete it (including all copies) and notify the sender by return email. Delivery 
of this Message to any person other than the intended recipient(s) shall not be deemed a waiver of confidentiality 
and/or a privilege. 

EFTA00818532


